NEmo | etc.

Certificate of Authorization #32455
353 Christian Street, Unit #13
Oxford, CT 06478

(203) 262-9245

ENGINEER EVALUATE TesT CoNsuLT

EVALUATION REPORT

GenFlex Roofing Systems Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1
A Division of Firestone Building Products Company, LLC. FL17802-R2
200 4tf‘ Avenue South Date of Issuance: 06/15/2015
Nashville, TN 37201 Revision 1: 09/25/2020
(317) 575-7017

SCOPE:

This Evaluation Report is issued under Rule 61G20-3 and the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of
construction materials in the State of Florida. The documentation submitted has been reviewed by Robert Nieminen,
P.E. for use of the product under the Florida Building Code. The product described herein has been evaluated for
compliance with the 7t" Edition (2020) Florida Building Code sections noted herein.

DESCRIPTION: GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems

LABELING: Labeling shall be in accordance with the requirements of the Accredited Quality Assurance Agency noted
herein.

CONTINUED COMPLIANCE: This Evaluation Report is valid until such time as the named product(s) changes, the referenced
Quality Assurance or production facility location(s) changes, or Code provisions that relate to the product(s) change.
Acceptance of our Evaluation Reports by the named client constitutes agreement to notify NEMO ETC, LLC of any
changes to the product(s), the Quality Assurance or the production facility location(s). NEMO ETC, LLC requires a
complete review of its Evaluation Report relative to updated Code requirements with each Code Cycle.

ADVERTISEMENT: The Florida Product Approval Number (FL#) preceded by the words “NEMO | etc. Evaluated” may be
displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the Evaluation Report is displayed, then it shall be done in its
entirety.

INSPECTION: Upon request, a copy of this entire Evaluation Report shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or
its distributors and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This Evaluation Report consists of pages 1 through 3, plus a 44-page Appendix.
Prepared by:

Robert J.M. Nieminen, P.E.
Florida Registration No. 59166, Florida DCA ANE1983

The facsimile seal appearing was authorized by Robert
Nieminen, P.E. on 09/25/2020. This does not serve as an
electronically signed document.

> st

it gt

) 1"
e Ay

CERTIFICATION OF INDEPENDENCE:

1. NEMO ETC, LLC does not have, nor does it intend to acquire or will it acquire, a financial interest in any company manufacturing or
distributing products it evaluates.

2. NEMO ETC, LLC is not owned, operated or controlled by any company manufacturing or distributing products it evaluates.

3. Robert Nieminen, P.E. does not have nor will acquire, a financial interest in any company manufacturing or distributing products for
which the evaluation reports are being issued.

4. Robert Nieminen, P.E. does not have, nor will acquire, a financial interest in any other entity involved in the approval process of the
product.

5. This is a building code evaluation. Neither NEMO ETC, LLC nor Robert Nieminen, P.E. are, in any way, the Designer of Record for any
project on which this Evaluation Report, or previous versions thereof, is/was used for permitting or design guidance unless retained
specifically for that purpose.

© 2019 NEMO ETC, LLC



NEmoO | etc.

ROOFING SYSTEMS EVALUATION:

1. SCOPE:
Product Category: Roofing
Sub-Category: Single Ply Roof Systems

Compliance Statement: GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems, as produced by GenFlex Roofing Systems, have
demonstrated compliance with the following sections of the 7* Edition (2020) Florida Building Code, HVHZ through
testing in accordance with the following Standards. Compliance is subject to the Installation Requirements and
Limitations / Conditions of Use set forth herein.

2. STANDARDS:

Section Property Standard Year
TAS 110 Resistance to Foot Traffic TAS 114, Section 8.9 2011
TAS 110 Wind resistance TAS 114, Appendix C, D or J 2011
TAS 110 Susceptibility Hail Damage TAS 114, Appendix F 2011
TAS 110 Susceptibility to Leakage TAS 114, Appendix G 2011
TAS 110 Material standard ASTM D6878 2013
TAS 110 Static puncture resistance ASTM D5602 2018
TAS 110 Dynamic puncture resistance ~ ASTM D5635 2018

3. REFERENCES:

Entity Examination Reference Date

NEMO Evaluation Report F47310.12.13-2-R3 04/09/2015
FM Approvals (CER1840) Traceability Private Label Agreement 06/04/2012
Miami-Dade (CER1592) Traceability Private Label Agreement 03/07/2013
UL, LLC (QUA9625) Quality Control Service Confirmation 04/10/2020

4, PRODUCT DESCRIPTION:

This Evaluation Report covers GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems installed in accordance with GenFlex Roofing
Systems published installation instructions and the Limitations / Conditions of Use herein.

TABLE 1: MEMBRANES FOR TPO SINGLE PLY ROOF SYSTEMS
Product Nominal Thickness (mil) Material Standard Plant(s)
GenFlex EZ TPO 45, 60, 80 ASTM D6878 AL, SC
GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO 45, 60, 80 ASTM D6878 AL
GenFlex EZ TPO Peel and Stick HW 60 ASTM D6878 AL

|

0 LIMITATIONS:

5.1 This is a Building Code Evaluation. Neither NEMO ETC, LLC nor Robert Nieminen, P.E. are, in any way, the Designer
of Record for any project on which this Evaluation Report, or previous versions thereof, is/was used for permitting
or design guidance unless retained specifically for that purpose.

5.2 This Evaluation Report is not for use in Non-High Velocity Hurricane Zone jurisdictions.

5.3 The evaluation herein pertains to above-deck roof components; deck-attachment details pertain to ‘as-tested’
conditions under Testing Application Standard TAS 114, Appendix J. Roof decks shall be in accordance with FBC
HVHZ requirements to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

5.4 This Evaluation Report does not include evaluation of fire classification. Refer to FBC HVHZ 1516 for requirements
and limitations regarding roof assembly fire classification. Refer to FBC 2603 for requirements and limitations
concerning the use of foam plastic insulation.

5.5 This Evaluation Report does not include evaluation of roof edge termination. Refer to Roofing Application
Standard RAS 111 for requirements and limitations regarding edge securement for low-slope roofs.

5.6 Refer to FBC HVHZ 1521 for requirements and limitations regarding recover installations.

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION FL17802-R2
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems Revision 1: 09/25/2020

Page 2 of 3



NEmoO | etc.

5.6.1 For mechanically attached components over existing roof decks, fasteners shall be tested in the existing deck for
withdrawal resistance. A qualified design professional shall review the data for comparison to the minimum
requirements for the system. Testing shall be in accordance with Testing Application Standard TAS 105.

5.6.2 For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a re-roof (tear off) or recover installation, the
existing deck or existing roof surface shall be examined for compatibility with the adhesive to be installed. If any
surface conditions exist that bring system performance into question, field uplift testing in accordance with Testing
Application Standard TAS 124 shall be conducted on mock-ups of the proposed new roof assembly.

5.6.3 For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a recover installation, the existing roof system shall
be capable of resisting project design pressures on its own merit to the satisfaction of the Authority Having
Jurisdiction, as documented through field uplift testing in accordance with Testing Application Standard TAS 124.

5.7 Refer to Appendix 1 for system attachment requirements for wind load resistance.

5.7.1 “MDP” = Maximum Design Pressure is the result of testing for wind load resistance based on allowable wind loads,
and reflects the ultimate passing pressure divided by 2 (the 2 to 1 margin of safety per Testing Application
Standard TAS 114 has already been applied). Refer to FBC HVHZ 1620 and Roofing Application Standard RAS 128
for determination of design wind loads.

5.7.2 For mechanically attached components, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly shall meet or
exceed at least the Zone 1 PRIME design pressure determined in accordance with FBC HVHZ 1620 or Roofing
Application Standard RAS 128. Elevated pressure zones shall employ an attachment density designed by a
qualified design professional to resist the elevated pressure criteria. Analysis shall be in accordance with Roofing
Application Standard RAS 117 or Roofing Application Standard RAS 137. *This extrapolation is not permitted
for systems marked with an asterisk*.

5.7.3 For assemblies marked with an asterisk*, the maximum design pressure (MDP) limitation shall be applicable to all
roof pressure zones. Rational analysis is not permitted.

5.8 All components in the roof assembly shall have quality assurance audit in accordance with F.A.C. Rule 61G20-3.
Refer to the Product Approval of the component manufacturer for components listed in Appendix 1 that are
produced by a Product Manufacturer other than the report holder on Page 1 of this Evaluation Report.

6. INSTALLATION:

GenFlex EZ TPO Roof Systems shall be installed in accordance with GenFlex Roofing Systems published installation
instructions, subject to the Limitations / Conditions of Use noted herein.

7. BUILDING PERMIT REQUIREMENTS:
As required by the Building Official or Authority Having Jurisdiction to properly evaluate the installation of this
product.

. MANUFACTURING PLANTS:

Contact the named QA entity for manufacturing facilities covered by F.A.C. Rule 61G20-3 QA requirements. Refer
to Section 4 herein for products and production locations having met codified material standards.

|

5 QUALITY ASSURANCE ENTITY:
UL, LLC — QUA9625; (414) 248-6409; karen.buchmann@ul.com

- THE 44-PAGES THAT FOLLOW FORM PART OF THIS EVALUATION REPORT —

|

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION FL17802-R2
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems Revision 1: 09/25/2020

Page 3 of 3


mailto:karen.buchmann@ul.com

NEmoO | etc.

APPENDIX 1: ATTACHMENT REQUIREMENTS FOR WIND UPLIFT RESISTANCE

TABLE DECK APPLICATION TYPE DESCRIPTION PAGE

1A Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover C-1 Mechanically Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 4
1B Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover C-2 Plate-Bonded Roof Cover 5
1C Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover 5
1D Wood New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover E-1 Non-Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover 5
2A Steel or Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover B-1 Mechanically Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 6-8
2B Steel New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover B-2 Mechanically Attached Base Insulation, Bonded Temp Roof, Bonded Top Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 9
2C Steel or Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover C-1 Mechanically Attached Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 10-13
2D Steel or Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover C-2 Plate-Bonded Roof Cover 13-14
2E Steel or Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover (Stress Plates) 15-17
2F Steel or Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off), Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover (Battens) 17-19
3A Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 20-25
3B Structural concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) F Non-Insulated, Bonded Roof Cover 25
aA Lightweight concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 26-33
4B Lightweight concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) or Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover 33
4c Lightweight concrete New, Reroof (Tear-Off) F Non-Insulated, Bonded Roof Cover 34-35
5A Cementitious wood fiber Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 36
5B Cementitious wood fiber Reroof (Tear-Off) A-2 Mechanically Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 36
6A Gypsum Reroof (Tear-Off) A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 37
6B Gypsum Reroof (Tear-Off) A-2 Mechanically Attached Anchor Sheet, Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 37
7A Various Recover A-1 Bonded Insulation, Bonded Roof Cover 38-42
7B Steel Recover C-2 Plate-Bonded Roof Cover 43
7C Steel Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover 43
7D Steel Recover D-1 Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover (RMA Strips) 43
7E Steel Recover E-1 Non-Insulated, Mechanically Attached Roof Cover 44
7F Various Recover F Non-Insulated, Bonded Roof Cover 44

The following notes apply to the systems outlined herein:

1 The roof system evaluation herein pertains to above-deck roof components. Roof decks and structural members shall be in accordance with FBC HVHZ requirements to the satisfaction of the Authority Having
Jurisdiction. Deck-attachment details pertain to ‘as-tested’ conditions under Testing Application Standard TAS 114, Appendix J.

2 Unless otherwise noted, fasteners and stress plates shall be as follows. Fasteners shall be of sufficient length for the following engagements:

» Wood Deck: GenFast #14 or #15(WH) Fasteners with GenFast Insulation Plates or GenFast AP Fasteners with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Fastening Plates. Minimum 1-inch plywood penetration or
wood plank embedment.

» Steel Deck: GenFast #14 or #15(WH) Fasteners with GenFast Insulation Plates or GenFast AP Fasteners with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Fastening Plates. Minimum %-inch steel penetration, engage
the top flute of the steel deck.

» Structural Concrete: GenFast #14 or #15(WH) Fasteners with GenFast Insulation Plates or GenFast AP Fasteners or GenFast Concrete Drive Fasteners with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Fastening Plates.

Minimum 1-inch embedment. Fasteners installed with a pilot hole in accordance with the fastener manufacturer’s published installation instructions.

3 Unless otherwise noted, insulation may be any one layer or combination of FBC Approved (Local or Statewide) board(s) that meet FBC HVHZ 1516 and, for foam plastic, FBC Chapter 26, when installed with the roof

cover.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 1 of 44



NEmoO | etc.

4 If mechanical attachment to the structural deck through lightweight insulating concrete is proposed, field withdrawal resistance testing shall be performed to confirm equivalent or determine enhanced fastening
patterns and density. All testing and fastening design shall be in compliance with Testing Application Standard TAS 105 and Roofing Application Standard RAS 117 and/or RAS 137. Calculations shall be prepared,
signed and sealed by a qualified design professional.

5  Preliminary insulation attachment for System Type D: Minimum four fasteners per 4 x 8 ft board or minimum two fasteners per 4 x 4 ft board.

6 Unless otherwise noted, insulation adhesive application rates are as follows. Ribbon or bead width is at the time of application; the ribbons/beads shall expand as noted in the manufacturer’s published
instructions.

» Hot asphalt: Full coverage, 20-40 Ibs/square.

» GenFlex One Step Insulation Adhesive (G-OSIA): Continuous % to %-inch beads, 12-inch o.c.

> Firestone I.S.0. FIX II: Continuous 0.75-inch beads, 8-inch o.c.

» Firestone I.S.0. Stick: Continuous 0.75 to 1-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c.

» ICP Adhesives Polyset CR-20: Continuous 2.5-3.5-inch wide ribbons, 12-inch o.c.

» Note: When multiple layers(s) of insulation and/or coverboard are installed in ribbon-applied adhesive, board joints shall be staggered.

» Note: The maximum edge distance from the adhesive ribbon to the edge of the insulation board shall be not less than one-half the specified ribbons spacing.

7  Unless otherwise noted, all insulations are flat-stock or taper board of the minimum thickness noted. Tapered polyisocyanurate at the following thickness limitations may be substituted with the following
Maximum Design Pressure (MDP) limitations. In no case shall these values be used to ‘increase’ the MDP listings in the tables; rather if MDP listing below meets or exceeds that listed for a particular system in the
tables, then the thinner board listed below may be used as a drop-in for the equivalent thicker material listed in the table.

Tapered GenFlex 1SO:

» Hot asphalt: MDP -120.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» GenFlex One Step Insulation Adhesive (G-OSIA): MDP -157.5 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» Firestone .S.0. FIX II: MDP -172.5 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» Firestone I.S.0. Stick: MDP -187.5 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» ICP Adhesives Polyset CR-20: MDP -117.5 psf (Min. 1.0-inch thick)

Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer:

» GenFlex One Step Insulation Adhesive (G-OSIA), 12-inch o.c.:  MDP  -165.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» GenFlex One Step Insulation Adhesive (G-OSIA), 6-inch o.c.: MDP  -405.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» Firestone I.S.0. FIX II, 12-inch o.c.: MDP  -165.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» Firestone I.S.0. FIX II, 6-inch o.c.: MDP  -405.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
» Firestone I.S.0. Stick, 12-inch o.c.: MDP  -165.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)
> Firestone I.S.0. Stick, 6-inch o.c.: MDP  -405.0 psf (Min. 0.5-inch thick)

8 Bonded polyisocyanurate insulation boards shall be maximum 4 x 4 ft.

9  For mechanically attached components, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly shall meet or exceed at least the Zone 1 PRIME design pressure determined in accordance with FBC HVHZ 1620 or
Roofing Application Standard RAS 128. Elevated pressure zones shall employ an attachment density designed by a qualified design professional to resist the elevated pressure criteria in accordance with Roofing
Application Standard RAS 117 or Roofing Application Standard RAS 137. *This extrapolation is not permitted for systems marked with an asterisk*

10 For assemblies marked with an asterisk*, the maximum design pressure for the selected assembly shall meet or exceed critical design pressure determined in accordance with FBC Chapter 16. No rational analysis
is permitted for these systems.

11  For mechanically attached components over existing decks, fasteners shall be tested in the existing deck for withdrawal resistance in accordance with Testing Application Standard TAS 105. A qualified design
professional shall review the data for comparison to the minimum requirements for the system. Should the fastener resistance be less than that required, a revised fastener spacing — prepared, signed and sealed
by a qualified design professional in accordance with Roofing Application Standard RAS 117 or Roofing Application Standard RAS 137 — may be submitted to the Building Official for review and acceptance.

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 2 of 44



NEmoO | etc.

12  Refer to FBC HVHZ 1521 for requirements and limitations regarding recover installations. For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a re-roof (tear off) or recover installation, the existing deck
or existing roof surface shall be examined for compatibility with the adhesive to be installed. If any surface conditions exist that bring system performance into question, field uplift testing in accordance shall be
conducted on mock-ups of the proposed new roof assembly. For bonded insulation or membrane over existing substrates in a recover installation, the existing roof system shall be capable of resisting project
design pressures on its own merit to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction, as documented through field uplift testing in accordance with Testing Application Standard TAS 124.

13 For Structural Concrete Deck or Recover Applications using System Type C-1, C-2, D-1 or D-2, the insulation is optional. Alternatively, an FBC HVHZ Approved insulation board or coverboard may be used as a
separation layer. Board products shall be preliminarily attached prior to roof cover installation (Note 5 herein). The separator component shall be documented as meeting FBC HVHZ 1516 and, for foam plastic,
FBC Chapter 26, when installed with the roof cover in Recover applications.

14  Lightweight insulating concrete (LWIC) shall be cast in accordance with FBC Section 1917 to the satisfaction of the Authority Having Jurisdiction. For systems where specific LWIC is referenced, refer to current
LWIC FBC HVHZ Product Approval for specific deck construction and limitations. Unless otherwise noted, for systems where specific LWIC is not referenced, the minimum design mix shall be 300 psi. In all cases,
the minimum top-coat thickness is 2-inches. For LWIC over structural concrete, reference is made to FBC Section 1917.4.1, Point 1. For “pre-existent” LWIC references, listings were established through testing
over lightweight concrete cast using only foaming agent (ASTM C896), water and Portland cement (ASTM C150), with no proprietary additives, in accordance with procedures adopted by Miami-Dade BCCO (FBC
CER1592). Use of these listings in new construction or re-roof (tear-off) applications is at the discretion of the Designer or Record and Authority Having Jurisdiction.

15  For single-ply membranes in System Type D-1 steel deck applications, the roof membrane shall be run with its length perpendicular to the steel deck flutes. For bonded membrane applications, unless otherwise
noted, refer to the following.

MEMBRANE / ADHESIVE COMBINATIONS
MEMBRANE ADHESIVE METHOD RATE

GenFlex EZ TPO EZ TPO Bonding Adhesive (EZ-BA) Contact Application 45 to 60 ft?/gal

GenFlex EZ TPO GenFlex Water Based Bonding Adhesive (P) (WBBA-P) Contact Application 100 to 120 ft?/gal.

GenFlex EZ TPO EZ TPO Bonding Adhesive LVOC (LVOC-BA) Contact Application 45 to 60 ft?/gal

GenFlex EZ TPO EZ TPO LVOC Bonding Adhesive 1168 (LVOC-BA-1168) Contact Application 45 to 60 ft?/gal

GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO GenFlex Fleece Backed Bonding Adhesive (EZ-FBBA) Substrate Application 70 to 90 ft*/gal

GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO GenFlex Water Based Bonding Adhesive (P) (WBBA-P) Substrate Application 100 to 120 ft*/gal.

GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO Firestone XR Stick Membrane Adhesive (XR Stick) Substrate Application Continuous % to 1-inch wide ribbons

16  Vapor barrier options for use over structural concrete deck followed by bonded insulation carry the following MDP limitations. The lesser of the MDP listings below vs. those in Table 3A applies.

VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS; STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECK; FOLLOWED BY ADHESIVE-APPLIED INSULATION PER TABLE 3A:

OPTION VAPOR BARRIER
PRIMER INSULATION ADHESIVE MDP (PSF)
# TYPE APPLICATION
GenFlex MB Base Sheet or Firestone MB Base, SBS Base, SBS Base-P, SBS PolyBase, SBS Firestone Multi-Purpose MB . . . *
CVB-1. | ASTMDAL Premium Base, SBS Premium Poly Base, APP 160 COOL or APP 170 COOL Cold Adhesive, 1.5-2.0 gal/sq. | ' restone Multi-Purpose MB Cold Adhesive 67.5
C-VB-2. None GenFlex MB Base Sheet ;r;z;one LiquiGard, 1.5-2.0 Firestone 1.5.0. Spray R, 12” o.c. -240.0*
C-VB-3. None GenFlex MB Base Sheet ;r;z;one tiquiGard, 1.5-2.0 G-0OSIA, 12” o.c. -240.0*
i Liqui 1.5-2. .
C-VB-4. None Firestone SBS Base, SBS Base-P, SBS PolyBase, SBS Premium Base, SBS Premium Poly Base ;r;z;one iquiGard, 1.5-2.0 Firestone 1.S.0. Spray R, 12” o.c. -240.0*
C-VB-5. | None Firestone SBS Base, SBS Base-P, SBS PolyBase, SBS Premium Base, SBS Premium Poly Base ;r;:one tiquiGard, 1.5-2.0 G-OSIA, 12” o.c. -240.0*
C-VB-6. ASTM D41 GenFlex MB Base Sheet G-OSIA, 4” o.c. G-OSIA, 12-inch o.c. -232.5%
1 or 2 plies GenFlex Type IV Ply Felt or GenFlex Type VI Ply Felt or 1 ply Firestone MB .
CVB-7. ASTM D41 Base, SBS Base, SBS Polybase or SBS Premium Base Hot asphalt Hot asphalt 120.0
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 3 of 44



NEmoO | etc.

VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS; STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECK; FOLLOWED BY ADHESIVE-APPLIED INSULATION PER TABLE 3A:

OPTION VAPOR BARRIER
PRIMER INSULATION ADHESIVE MDP (PSF)
# TYPE APPLICATION

1 or 2 plies GenFlex Type IV Ply Felt or GenFlex Type VI Ply Felt or 1 ply Firestone MB

~ ” - *
Base, SBS Base, SBS Polybase or SBS Premium Base Hot asphalt 1:5.0. Spray R or G-OSIA, 12" o.c. 495.0

C-VB-8. ASTM D41

GenFlex SBS Base Sheet GT or Firestone SBS Poly Torch Base, SBS Glass Torch Base, SBS . ” «
C-VB-9. ASTM D41 Glass Torch Base 1.5, SBS Smooth Torch-applied 1.5.0. Spray R or G-OSIA, 12” o.c. 495.0

SA-Solvent Based

/R : 3 . ” R %

C-VB-10. (SB) Primer GenFlex Vapor Shield Membrane Self-adhering 1.5.0. Spray R, 12” o.c. 255.0

C-VB-11. SA—SoI\./ent Based GenFlex Vapor Shield Membrane Self-adhering 1.S.0. Stick, 12” o.c. -262.5*%
(SB) Primer

C-VB-12. (S:‘;)Sglr\i/;r;trBased GenFlex Vapor Shield Membrane Self-adhering G-OSIA, 12" o.c. -255.0*

17  For membrane attachment using batten-strips, batten-strip end laps shall be spliced with sufficient dimension to allow for minimum 2-fasteners at each batten-strip lap.
18  For System Type C-2 (induction weld), care shall be taken to ensure that the plates do not line-up with membrane seams. This condition may preclude proper induction welding of the membrane to the plates.
19  For System Types B-1, B-2 and C-1 over steel deck, GenFlex Vapor Shield Membrane, self-adhered, may be installed atop the steel roof deck prior to installation of subsequent insulation components.

20 “MDP” = Maximum Design Pressure is the result of testing for wind load resistance based on allowable wind loads. Refer to FBC (HVHZ) 1620 and Roofing Application Standard RAS 128 for determination of design
wind loads.

TABLE 1A: WOOD DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

N Top Insulation Layer
System Deck Base Insulation Layer Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) (Note 13) Type R Attach (psf)
(Note 11)
Min. 19/32-inch plywood or wood plank; (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-1168,
w-1 24” span; 8d nails 6” o.c. combination, loose laid Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 1.8 ft? WBBA, WBBA-P 45.0
Min. 19/32-inch plywood or wood plank; .
. R (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-1168,
-2. 24" ; 0.113” x 2-3/8” " - . .1 -45.
W-2 04c span; 0.113” x 2-3/8” ring shank nails 6 combination, loose laid Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Glass Facer Note 2 1.6 f2 LVOC-BA 45.0
Min. 19/32-inch plywood or wood plank; (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber 1 per
- 2 EZ EZ-B. BB BBA- -45.
W-3 24” span; 8d nails 6” o.c. combination, loose laid Roof Board, DensDeck or DensDeck Prime Note 1.6 ft? GenFlex EZTPO/ A, WBBA, WBBA-P 45.0
Min. 19/32-inch plywood or wood plank; (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber 1 per
w-4 24” span; 8d nails 6” o.c. combination, loose laid Roof Board or DensDeck Prime Note 2 1.6 ft2 GenFlex EZTPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -45.0
in. 19/32-i ; . . . .
W-5 2M4I’r’1s agfo T{:;F;Iyzv_v;/c;c’i’ (:i;w‘s)r?:nilir;'i?s 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-1168, 675
’ oc pan; ©. g combination, loose laid Roof Board 1.8 ft? LVOC-BA :
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 4 of 44



NEmo | etc.
TABLE 1B: WOOD DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-2: PLATE-BONDED ROOF COVER

Syst: Deck Insulation Layer Attach MDP
ystem U = Roof Cover (Note 18)
No. (Note 1) (Note 13) Fasten (Note 11) Density / Pattern (psf)
Min. 19/32—|ncrjyplywood or (Optlonal). On.e or mor.e Ifayers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and Max. 6-inch o.c. in rows max. G<.enFIe)$ EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex E.Z TPO InV|5|WeI.d Plates
W-6. wood plank; 24” span; 8d any combination, preliminarily - . with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and weighted -52.5
A GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates 72-inch o.c. . .
nails 6” o.c. attached RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.
Min. 19/32-mcflplvwo0d or (OptlonaI} One or more Iévefs, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and 12 parts per 4 x 8 ft board ngFIe)f EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZTPO InV|5|WeI.d Plates
W-7. wood plank; 24” span; 8d any combination, preliminarily L with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and weighted -52.5
S GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates 1 per 2.7 ft? . .
nails 6” o.c. attached RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.
Min. 19/32—|ncflplywood or (Optlonal). Onfa or mor.e I.auyeljs, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and Max. 6-inch o.c. in rows max. ngFIe){ EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex I?Z TPO InV|S|WeI.d Plates
W-8. wood plank; 24” span; #8 any combination, preliminarily L . with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and weighted -82.5
” GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates 60-inch o.c. . .
screws 6” o.c. attached RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.

TABLE 1C: WOOD DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER

System Deck Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Optional min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer
Min. 19/32-|nct',n,plywood or | followed b-y min. 0.25-inch DgnsDec}(, DensDeck Prime or SI?CURQCK prelim. GenFlex EZTPO | GenFast HD Fasteners with 5-inch o.c. vs{|th|n 6-inch wide laps
W-9. wood plank; 24” span; 8d Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board, min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1SO, min. 1-inch attached (min. 60-mil) GenFast HD Seam Plates spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed -45.0
nails 6” o.c. GenFlex Coated Glass Facer or min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Composite : with 1.5-inch heat weld.
I1SO
Min. 19/32-inch plywood or 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps
wood plank; 24” span; 10d . . . L Prelim. GenFast HD Fasteners with spaced 90.5-inch o.c. Laps sealed
Ww-10. nails 4” o.c. at perimeter; 8d Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more layers, any combination attached GenFlex EZTPO GenFast HD Seam Plates with 5-inch heat weld that 60.0
nails 6” o.c. in field encapsulates plates.

TABLE 1D: WOOD DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE E-1: NON-INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER

System Deck Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
W-11, Ml'n. 1,9,)/32-|nch plywood or wood plank; 24” span; 8d GenFlex EZ TPO GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast HD 6-inch o.c. wnt.hln 6-|r?ch wide laps spaced 72-inch o.c. 450
nails 6” o.c. Seam Plates Laps sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 5 of 44



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2A: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B-1: MECHANICALLY FASTENED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
ystem ec
Attach Roof Cover (Note 15
No. (Note 1) Type Fastener Attach Type ( ) (psf)
(Note 11) (Notes 6,7.8)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS
1 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel | Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per2.7 Sapct::?z:lg’v::;'dlf':ﬁ: %e:TLi’;izat:riglass 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, 150
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | Coated Glass Facer ft2 4 - P G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
GenFlex Coated Glass Facer
. Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel | Min. 2-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per4.0 Sa':’ct;‘::z:lgqv::’e'dlf':ﬁ: %e:fLi’;iZat:r‘ig'ass 1.5.0. FIXIl; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, 450"
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | Coated Glass Facer ote ft? 4 - P G-0OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
GenFlex Coated Glass Facer
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel . . 1per4.0 . . . 1.S.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, «
SC-3. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 2 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1per2.7 . . . 1.5.0. FIX I1; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, «
SC-4. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO Note 2 f2 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1per2.0 . . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, .
SC-S. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO Note 2 ft2 Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1SO G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA 45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel . . 1per2.0 . . . GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, "
SC-6. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 2 Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD I1SO 1.S.0. FIX 11; 1.S.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168 , LVOC-BA -45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; . .
SC-7. 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 1 p(:trzl.o Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD I1SO I(:;Sé)S'IZIX I1;1.5.0. STICK; Sf;::); ESZ TPO / WBBA, -45.0
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1per2.0 Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or G-OSIA, 1.5.0. STICK or "
SC8. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO Note 2 ft? SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 450
sc.9 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per2.0 Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-0SIA, 1.S.0. STICK or GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA- -45.0*
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO ft2 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 1168 ’
Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck . . .
10 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel | Prime or SECUROCK Note 2 1 per 4.0 Sa"‘ct;”;z:lg‘v:l’; dlf"r':ﬁ: %esn_fi’;i;at:ij'ass 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, 45.0*
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | Gypsum-Fiber Roof ft? 4 e P G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
Board GenFlex Coated Glass Facer
Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck,
sc11 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel DensDeck Prime or Note 2 1 per 2.0 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO followed by min. 0.5- 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, -45.0*
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | SECUROCK Gypsum- ft2 inch FiberTop Cor S G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
Fiber Roof Board
Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck
. . ! Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO followed by Min. GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA
Min. 22 ga., t B, G teel DensD 1 2. 1.S.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; !
sc-12. in. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 stee ensDeck Prime or Note 2 Per2:0 | 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK >0 FIXI;1L5.0.5TICK 1 |yoc-a-1168, Lvoc-8a, -45.0%
or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | SECUROCK Gypsum- ft X G-OSIA
Fiber Roof Board Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board WBBA, WBBA-P-S
13 gl'll:.aznZS'g‘T';"aE(\;(’;: ?Cri:;%e ‘?CSt:re'; Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per1.6 | Min.0.5-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, €00
’ minp2 5’00 psi structural con.c;'ete ISO ft2 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 6 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2A: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE B-1: MECHANICALLY FASTENED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
ystem ec|
Attach Roof Cover (Note 15
No. (Note 1) Type Fastener Attach Type { ) (psf)
(Note 11) (Notes 6,7.8)
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6’ . .
Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex
spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH screw 1perl.8 . ) . . GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-14. 6" o.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural Iél(;sc;rF(aicenglex Coated Note 2 e Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Composite 1ISO 1.5.0. STICK, 12-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA 60.0
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6’ . . .
” ” . . 1perl8 Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof . GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-15. spans; 5/8” puddle welds 6” o.c. or Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 ) 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch o.c. -67.5
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete ft Board LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA
SC.16 Zl:r;:nzyg'?;aiir;: iizj%ﬁ i3cst:rel; :\sgoié;:;:;gzzlgé Note 2 1perl.6 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, 75.0
-16. 5 .C. ) - oA g -75.
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Glass Facer ft Glass Facer LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
! . " . . 1perl.6 . . 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-17. ?ni;pa;n;b;rs::(;srjz;i\:;|6c0c:].;:tre Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO | Note 2 2 Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -82.5
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
. . 1perl1.0 . . 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA
18, " T 7 o.c. 2 0.5- ; ; , 90,
SC-18 Smi;pazn;,()or;::(itsrzzz\:;|6cocr>];:r:t; Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO | Note 2 2 Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA 90.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
1 1.0 1.5.0. FIX 11; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA
SC-19. 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 p?trz Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO G-OSIA 4—i’nch oc ’ V\anBAe—)Ii / ! -105.0
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete ! .
SC-20 l’;/'“:.a\znZS'g‘T'.r‘a?;r;: ii;jd; ?;305'frel; Min. 2-inch GenFlex 1SO Note 2 1per 1.0 Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. FIX 11; 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, -105.0
’ minpz 5’00 psi structural con.c;*ete ’ ft2 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
, . 5 . . 1per 1.0 . . 1.5.0. FIX 11; 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-21. ii;pzn;bgr:;(;(gijgi\:;FCOC;E;;; Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO | Note 2 2 Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -112.5
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
6’ spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1per 1.0 . . 1.S.0. FIXII; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
s¢-22. 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural Coated Glass Facer Note 2 f2 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Coated Glass Facer G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -120.0
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel;
6’ spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” . . 1perl.0 . . 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-23. 0.¢. or min. 2,500 psi structural Min. 2-inch GenFlex1SO | Note 2 ft2 Min. 1-inch GenFlex 1SO G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA -127:5
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel;
6’ spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” . . 1perl.0 . ) 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
SC-24. o.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural Min. Z-inch GenFlexIS0 | Note 2 ft2 Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA 1350
concrete
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS:

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 7 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 2A: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE B-1: MECHANICALLY FASTENED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
ystem ec
Attach Roof Cover (Note 15
No. (Note 1) Type Fastener Attach Type ( ) (psf)
(Note 11) (Notes 6,7.8)
Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck, . . .
s Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel | DensDeck Prime or Note 2 1 per 2.0 m;ﬂ;;’e'ﬁ? (ée::ée;r'fﬁrg"z“;:fg l;:zl:sl())esck 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 45.0*
' or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | SECUROCK Gypsum- ft2 . P o G-0OSIA TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
Fiber Roof Board Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 2.25-inch GenFlex 1per4d.0 . . 1.5.0. FIX I1; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed «
SC-26. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO Note 2 ft2 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 150 G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. 45.0
Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO followed by min. 0.5-
sc.27 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per2.0 inch FiberTop C or S wood fiber or Min. 0.25- 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed -45.0*
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO ft2 inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum- G-0OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. ’
Fiber Roof Board
sc28 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per2.0 Optional min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO followed by 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed -45.0*
’ or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete | 1SO ft2 min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. ’
“cas g':':nzs_gi'r'ai‘;’;: Eci:;cée ?:t:re"' Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1per1.6 | Min.0.5-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.5.0. STICK; | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 600
’ minp2 5’00 psi structural cor{c;ete I1SO ft2 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. ’
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; . .
SC-30. 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 ! per21.6 Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO 1.5.0. FIX “.’ 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ.FIeecg Backed -82.5
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete ft G-O0SIA, 6-inch o.c. TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; . .
SC-31. 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO | Note 2 ! perzl.s Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO 1.5.0. FIX “.' 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ.FIeecg Backed -82.5
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete ft G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel;
6’ spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” . . 1per 1.0 Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. FIX Il; 1.5.0. STICK; GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
SC32. 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural Min. 2-inch GenFlex 1SO Note 2 ft? Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. TPO / XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -127:5
concrete

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION

GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2

Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 8 of 44



TABLE 2B: STEEL DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE B-2: MECHANICALLY FASTENED BASE INSULATION, BONDED TEMP ROOF, BONDED TOP INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Deck Base Insulation Layer Insulation MDP
ystem ec
Temp Roof Attach Roof Cover (Note 15
No. (Note 1) Type Fasten Attach P Type ( ) (psf)
(Note 11) (Notes 6,7,8)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS
. . . Two plies GenFlex Type Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex I1SO followed by Min. 0.25-inch Hot asphalt GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
Min. 22 ga. B, Min. 0.75-inch FM 1 2. . . .
SC-33. Gr';‘ o 33git'et;’|pe g A '”rgvez '"ecr“te Note 2 p'fatrz O |\ or Type Vi in hot DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof or 1.5.0. LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -45.0%
PP P asphalt Board STICK BA, WBBA, WBBA-P
Min. 0.25-inch
) DensDeck or min. 0.5- GenFlex SB Primer; . . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA
Min. 22 ga. B ; 1 per 4. v [ . 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO, ’
SC-34. Gr';‘ o 33git'et;’|pe g inch SECUROCK Note 2 p'fatrz O | GenFlex Vapor Shield, 2"5;;;;:5 gy:_'i;:;";a jrelzr:ch;eFTexel); OSO 1.5.0.STICK | LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -45.0%
Gypsum-Fiber Roof self-adhered P T p BA, WBBA, WBBA-P
Board
Min. 0.25-inch One or more layers min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO,
Min. 22 ga. tvpe B DensDeck or min. 0.5- 1 per 4.0 GenFlex SB Primer; optional min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO; Min. 0.5- GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
SC-35. Gra('ie 33g s't,eg_/lp ! inch SECUROCK Note 2 pftl : GenFlex Vapor Shield, inch FiberTop C or S or GenFlex HD ISO or Min. 0.25- 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -45.0*
Gypsum-Fiber Roof self-adhered inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber BA, WBBA, WBBA-P
Board Roof Board; or Min. 19/32-inch plywood
Min. 0.25-inch
| in. 1.5-inch Flex |
Min. 22 ga.. tvoe B DensDeck or min. 0.5- 1per4.0 GenFlex SB Primer; gngoonra:n;:: gy:-riigl?ra esr::ch;eFTexel);Os'ol\l/lin GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
SC-36. - o Ba. lype B, inch SECUROCK Note 2 pers. GenFlex Vapor Shield, ptia o B s Vi 1.5.0.STICK | LVOC-BA, WBBA, -45.0%
Grade 33 steel . ft 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof
Gypsum-Fiber Roof self-adhered WBBA-P
Board Board
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS
gﬂe;:-sg;ezcsl;::lr;in 0.5- GenFlex SB Primer: One or more layers min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO,
sc-37 Min. 22 ga., type B, inch SECUROCK T Note 2 1 per4.0 GenElex Vanor Shit,eld optional min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO; Min. 0.5- 15.0. STICK GenFlex EZ Fleece 450"
’ Grade 33 steel Gypsum-Fiber Roof ft? self—adherez ! inch FiberTop C or S or Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck R Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA '
BZgrd Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 9 of 44




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2C: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
System No. Y d Lk Roof Cover (Note 15)
(Note 1) (Note 13) Type Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- "
SC-38. min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 4.0 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA 45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- «
SC-39. min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Min. 1.25-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 2.7 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P 45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- *
SC-40. min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 150 Note 2 2.0 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA 45.0
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6’ .
e rom Y (Optional) One or more layers, any . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-41. sp.ans, 5/8 pyddle welds 6” o.c. or combination, loose laid Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 272 1168, LVOC-BA 45.0
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .
SC-42. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. (Opt|c?nal? One or mo!'e layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 L perz GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA -45.0
R combination, loose laid 2.7 ft 1168, LVOC-BA
2,500 psi structural concrete
sc.a3 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 45,0
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Coated Glass Facer 2.7 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P ’
sc.aa Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 45.0%
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Glass Facer 2.0 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P ’
sc.a5 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 45.0*
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Composite I1SO 4.0 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P ’
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ . . .
SC-46. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. ormin. | \OPtional) One ormore layers, any | Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 LPEr | GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P 45,0
R combination, loose laid Composite I1SO 1.3 ft
2,500 psi structural concrete
sc.a7 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -45.0*
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid 1SO 2.7 ft? 1168 ’
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ . . ) . .
Min. 1.5-inch thick, Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1
SC-48. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” 0.c. or min. in. 1.5-inch thick, one or more in. 0.5-inch GenfFlex Note 2 Per | GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, WBBA-P 45.0
R layers, any combination, loose laid 1SO 1.3 ft
2,500 psi structural concrete
scas Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or iﬁi‘;i'og:"efg: gicr‘;"lzr)e':g”;’no‘s"“d' Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck Note 2 lper | GenFlex EZTPO /EZ-BA, LVOC-BA, 450"
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete C y » Ay Prime 2.7 ft2 WBBA-S ’
combination, loose laid
$C-50 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 45.0*
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 2.0 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P ’
in. 22 ga. B i ;6 . .
st LV';"”S. 55;,,' tz’;zle’;zlzss' gteoelc Gor One or more layers, any Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK Note 2 1per | GenFlex EZTPO /EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 450
' pans; pL - combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.8 ft2 1168, LVOC-BA )
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more . . . 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-52. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. layers, any combination, loose laid Min. 19/32-inch plywood GenFast HailGard Fastener 2.7 ft? 1168 45.0

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

#32455

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2

Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 10 of 44



TABLE 2C: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
System No. Y d Lk Roof Cover (Note 15)
(Note 1) (Note 13) Type Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6’
sc-53 spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH screw 6” | (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 525
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.6 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA ’
concrete
sc-s5a. Min. 22 ga., type B, Gra”de 33 steel; 6 Min. 1.5-inch thl(.:k, qne or more' Min. 19/32-inch plywood GenFast HailGard Fastener 1 per2 GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 525
spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. layers, any combination, loose laid 1.6 ft 1168
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .
SC-55. spans; 5/8” puddle weld 6” o.c. or (Opt|9nal? One or mo!'e layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1ISO Note 2 ! perz GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA -60.0
. . combination, loose laid 1.8 ft 1168
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6’
SC.56 spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH screw 6” | One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -60.0
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.8 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA ’
concrete
Min. 22 ga. B l; 6 . . . . .
n ga. type B, Gride 3 stee. ;6 Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-57. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. L . Note 2 2 -60.0
R layers, any combination, loose laid 1SO 1.3 ft 1168, LVOC-BA
2,500 psi structural concrete
sc-58 'S\A:r;sz.z_rrg:)'(’x%psizvszd: jsoitrieilr: 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 60.0
' pans; 1 - ’ combination, loose laid Composite ISO 1.3 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA )
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., t B, G ; 6 Min. 0.5-inch DensDeck
n ga., type b, raide 33;6 Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more !n 0.5-inch DensDec 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-59. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. steel or lavers. anv combination. loose laid Prime or SECUROCK Note 2 13 f2 1168 -75.0
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Yers, any ’ Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board ’
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33; 6 Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more . ) GenFast 3" Round Insulation Plates 1per | GenFlex EZTPO /EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-60. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. steel or o . Min. 19/32-inch plywood GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 5 -75.0
. K layers, any combination, loose laid . 2.0 ft 1168
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Concrete Drive (concrete only)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .
Opt 1)O | 3 . . 1 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-61. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. (Op |(?na ) neor mo‘re ayers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 perz enriex / -75.0
R combination, loose laid 1.6 ft 1168
2,500 psi structural concrete
sc62 L\manr;jz'rrgaa;;(?_’:psizmc/ir;’d: jaosrtx: 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 75.0
’ pans; ) - ’ combination, loose laid Coated Glass Facer 1.6 ft2 1168, LVOC-BA ’
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ . . .
SC-63. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. | \OPtional) One ormore layers, any | Min. 2-inch GenFlex Coated |\ . » LPer | G enFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P 75.0
R combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.0 ft
2,500 psi structural concrete
in. 22 ga. B ;6 . . .
sc-64 'sw:nS' Trg:x,x%psecrelvf:’d: :30?;?:; 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 825
' pans; 1r - ’ combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.6 ft2 1168, LVOC-BA )
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi steel; 6’ . .
. 0.5 E 1
SC-65. spans; 5/8” puddle welds 6” o.c. or One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK Note 2 Per | GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -82.5
. . combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.8 ft
min. 2,500 psi structural concrete

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 11 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 2C: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE C-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
System No. Y d Lk Roof Cover (Note 15)
(Note 1) (Note 13) Type Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .
SC-66. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. (Opt|o.nal? One or m°.re layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex I1SO Note 2 ! perz GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA -90.0
R combination, loose laid 1.3 ft 1168
2,500 psi structural concrete
sC67 L\manr.]sz-z'l'rg;;x%psizm?r;’df casosrtriei: 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 105.0
' pans; Tt o ’ combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.3 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA )
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Gr:ide 3 stegl; 6 Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more M!n. 0.5-inch DensDeck 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-68. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. L . Prime or SECUROCK Note 2 2 -105.0
} layers, any combination, loose laid X 1.0ft 1168
2,500 psi structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; &' (Optional) One or more layers, an 1 per
SC-69. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. P I . yers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 P N GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -112.5
R combination, loose laid 1.0 ft
2,500 psi structural concrete
$C-70 ls\/I;nr;SZ.ZTrg:).(,x;\épseczvf;d: :3§:er:i|;]6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 1125
' pans; 1r - ’ combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.0 ft2 1168, LVOC-BA )
2,500 psi structural concrete
se71 :A;nr;sz.i—f:)&%p;z\f?d: :305::?: 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 1125
’ pans; . - ’ combination, loose laid Composite ISO 1.3 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA ’
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6" | . 1 o1 thick one or more Min. 0.5-inch SECUROCK lper | GenFlex EZTPO /EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-72. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. L . . Note 2 2 -112.5
) layers, any combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.0ft 1168, LVOC-BA
2,500 psi structural concrete
sc-73 :A;nr;sz.z_rf:);’x%p;zv?r;d; :305:::5: 6 (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 120.0
’ pans; . - ’ combination, loose laid Composite 1SO 1.3 ft? 1168, LVOC-BA ’
2,500 psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel; &' (Optional) One or more layers, an 1 per
SC-74. spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. ptiona’) re1ayers,any | Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 Per | GenFlex EZTPO/EZ-BA -150.0
) R combination, loose laid 1.0 ft
or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
SC.75 Lv'Ianr.]sz~2t\52.'(;\)/?riai’x(/agasgfe?ssésl:;cs (Optional) One or more layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex Coated Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 150.0
’ P > ) N combination, loose laid Glass Facer 1.0 ft2 1168, LVOC-BA ’
or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete
in. 22 ga. B ;6 . . . 4 i
Min ga, type B, Grade 33 st’elzel, 6 Min. 1.5-inch thick, one or more . . GenFast 3" Round Insulation Plates 1 per GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
SC-76. spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. L . Min. 19/32-inch plywood GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 5 -150.0
. R layers, any combination, loose laid . 1.0 ft 1168
or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Concrete Drive (concrete only)
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS
Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
sc-77 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Prime or min. 0.5-inch Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / EZ- 45.0*
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber 2.7 ft? FBBA ’
Roof Board
SC.78 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch FiberTop Cor S Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / EZ- 45.0%
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid wood fiber 2.0 ft? FBBA ’

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 12 of 44

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2C: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Deck Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer MDP
System No. Y d Lk Roof Cover (Note 15)
(Note 1) (Note 13) Type Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)

$c.79. M.ln. 22 ga., t\./pe B, Grade 33 steel or (Opt|9nal? One or more layers, any Min. 1.5-inch GenElex ISO Note 2 1 per2 ngFIex ITZZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR -45.0*

min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid 2.0ft Stick, 12-inch o.c.
sc.80. M'ln. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or (Optlc?nal? One or more layers, any Min. 2.25-inch GenFlex 1SO Note 2 1 perz Ge'anIex I?Z Fleece Backed TPO / XR -45.0*

min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid 4.0 ft Stick, 12-inch o.c.

Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
sc.81 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Prime or SECUROCK Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR -45.0*
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board or 2.0 ft? Stick, 12-inch o.c. ’
min. 19/32-inch plywood
. One or more layers, any . .

Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or L . . Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1 per GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR "

SC-82. min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid (optional ISO Note 2 2.1ft? Stick, 12-inch o.c. 450
for recover)
sc.83 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel or One or more layers, any Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD Note 2 1 per GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR 45.0%
’ min. 2,500 psi structural concrete combination, loose laid 1SO 2.0 ft? Stick, 4-inch o.c. ’

Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .

SC-84. spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” o.c. or min. (Opt|o.nal? One or m°_re layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 1 perz ngFIex. EZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR -82.5
R combination, loose laid 1.6 ft Stick, 6-inch o.c.

2,500 psi structural concrete

Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel; 6’ .
SC-85. spans; two (2) Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. (Opthnal? One or m°_re layers, any Min. 2-inch GenFlex ISO Note 2 ! perz ngFIex. EZ Fleece Backed TPO / XR -142.5

. . combination, loose laid 1.0 ft Stick, 4-inch o.c.
or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete

TABLE 2D: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-2: PLATE-BONDED ROOF COVER

Deck Insulation Attach
System Vapor & Air Barrier - Roof Cover (Note 18) mbP
No. (Note 1) (Note 13) Fasten (Note 11) Density / Pattern (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners or GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
SC.86 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” None any combination, GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete Max. 12-inch o.c. in rows InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 450
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural preliminarily only) and GenFlex EZ TPO max. 60-inch o.c. Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
concrete attached InvisiWeld Plates Cooling Clamps.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners or GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
sc.87 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” None any combination, GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete Max. 6-inch o.c. in rows InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 825
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural preliminarily only) and GenFlex EZ TPO max. 60-inch o.c. Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
concrete attached InvisiWeld Plates Cooling Clamps.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 1 per 5.3 ft2 (6 parts per 4x8 Ger‘ﬂ'tlex EZTPO bor?ded tp GenFlex EZTPO
sc.88 steel or min. 2.500 bsi structural None One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and ft board) InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 45,0
’ T P any combination GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond '
concrete Per FM LPDS 1-29 / RAS 117 .
Cooling Clamps.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 13 of 44



TABLE 2D: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-2: PLATE-BONDED ROOF COVER

NEmoO | etc.

Syst: Deck Insulation Attach MDP
ystem Vapor & Air Barrier = Roof Cover (Note 18)
No. (Note 1) (Note 13) Fasten (Note 11) Density / Pattern (psf)
. . , . . Min. 2.5-inch
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; 6 GenFlex Vapor Shield with GenFlex 1SO. GenFlex 1 per 4.0 ft2 (8 parts per 4x8 GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
Ssc-89 spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH min. 3-inch side laps self- Coated Glas; Facer GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and i Zoara) ina sz 24pinch InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 525
’ screw 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 psi adhered to top flanges of or GenFlex HD GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates rid Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
structural concrete steel deck Composite IS0 g Cooling Clamps.
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; @ | V- 0-25-inch SECUROCK | Min. 2.5-inch R GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
” Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board GenFlex ISO, GenFlex 1 per 4.0 ft? (8 parts per 4x8 L . )
spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and . R InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable
SC-90. ” . . followed by GenFlex Vapor | Coated Glass Facer L ft board) in a 24 x 24-inch . ) A -52.5
screw 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 psi Shield with min. 3-inch or GenFlex HD GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates grid Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond
structural concrete side laps self-adhered Composite 1SO Cooling Clamps.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 1 per 4.0 ft? (8 parts per 4x8 GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
sc.91 steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” None One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and ft boara) InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 60.0
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural any combination GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
Per FM LPDS 1-29 / RAS 117 R
concrete Cooling Clamps.
GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners with
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 alternating Rows of: 1 per 2.0 ft2 (16 parts per GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
sc.92 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” None One or more layers, 1.) GenFlex EZTPO InvisiWeld 4:; & b'oard) in ;12 xg4— InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable €75
’ 0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural any combination Plates inch erid Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
concrete 2.) GenFast 3” Round Insulation & Cooling Clamps.
Plates
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screws 6” 1 per 2.7 ft2 (12 parts per GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
sc-03 o.c., or Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi None One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and 4x8 fit i;;oard) InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 75.0
’ steel; 6’ spans; 5/8” puddle welds any combination GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates Per FM LPDS 1-29 / RAS 117 Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
6” o.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural er g Cooling Clamps.
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 1 per 2.0 ft2 (16 parts per GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO
sc.9a steel; 6 spans; two (2) Traxx/5 None One or more layers, GenFast #15(WH) Fasteners and 4x8 ft l;;oard) InvisiWeld Plates with RhinoBond Portable 105.0
’ screws 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 psi any combination GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates Per FM LPDS 1-29 / RAS 117 Plate Bonding Tool and weighted RhinoBond :
structural concrete er : Cooling Clamps.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION

GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2

Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 14 of 44



TABLE 2E: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (STRESS PLATES)

System Deck . . Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Vapor & Air Barrier
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22'ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel ; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ . . .
SC-95. o.c. min. 2.500 psi structural None one or more layers, Prelim. attached 1P0 Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 72-inch o.c. Laps -45.0
- - P any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80
steel or min. 20 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-96. Grade 33 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 None one or more layers, Prelim. attached TPO or TPO GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps -45.0
screw 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi any combination XR with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
structural concrete
Min. 22 ga. type B, Grade 80 ) . B 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel or min. 20 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or .
A . GenFlex EZ . laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps
SC-97. Grade 33 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) R . -45.0
” R A - TPO . sealed with 5-inch heat weld
screw 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates
that encapsulates plates.
structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80
steel or min. 20 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-98. Grade 33 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 None one or more layers, Prelim. attached 0 Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps -45.0
screw 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” . . . . e .
R ) Min. 1-inch thick, GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
o.c. or Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi . GenFlex EZ . .
SC-99. ) ” None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps -45.0
steel; 6’ spans; 5/8” puddle - TPO ) R )
” . R any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
welds 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi
structural concrete
Min. 22 62 type B, Grade 80 ) ! : 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel or min. 20 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast X
, . GenFlex EZ . . laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps
SC-100. Grade 33 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 None one or more layers, Prelim. attached Concrete Drive (concrete only) with R . -45.0
” . . - TPO sealed with 5-inch heat weld
screw 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates
that encapsulates plates.
structural concrete
. . Min. 0.5-inch
Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi steel; ?n?:F;e?n\é;TiJgeslr:eLds:I?h GenFlex IS0, Note 2 (HD only) 1 GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast HD 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-101. 6’ spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH : P GenFlex Coated Glass | per 8 ft2 laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps -45.0
M adhered to top flanges of . . TPO Seam Plates R .
screw 6” o.c. Facer or GenFlex HD 24x72-inch grid sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
steel deck
ISO
Min. 22, ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ . . .
SC-102. o.c. min. 2.500 psi structural None one or more layers, Prelim. attached 0 Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 72-inch o.c. Laps -52.5
cc.)r;creté ’ P any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020

GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Appendix 1, Page 15 of 44




TABLE 2E: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TeAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (STRESS PLATES)

System Deck . . Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Vapor & Air Barrier
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22'ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . TPO orEZ . i . -52.5
SC-103. X . None one or more layers, Prelim. attached Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - Fleece Backed | .
any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete TPO
Min. 0.25-inch SECUROCK
Min. 22 ga., type B, 50 ksi steel; Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Min. 3-inch GenFlex Note 2 (HD only) 1 . 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-104. 6’ spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH followed by GenFlex Vapor | 1SO or GenFlex per 4.0 ft? _(F‘:cr;Flex Bz S:;nia;ItaI:eDs Fasteners with GenFast HD laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps -52.5
screw 6” o.c. Shield with min. 3-inch Coated Glass Facer 24x24-inch grid sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
side laps self-adhered
. . Min. 0.5-inch Note 2 (HD only) 1
Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi steel; an?:F;e?n\:EZ(inresgelsds:’I:‘th GenFlex1S0, per 5.3 ft? GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast HD 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-105. 6’ spans; #12-24 x 1-1/4” HWH ) P GenFlex Coated Glass | 24x36-inch grid, laps spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps -52.5
. adhered to top flanges of ) TPO Seam Plates R .
screw 6” o.c. Facer or GenFlex HD 12-inch from sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
steel deck
1SO board edges
Min. ZZ‘ga., type B, Grade 80 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ . . .
SC-106. X R None one or more layers, Loose Laid Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps -52.5
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - TPO . .
any combination GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete
6-inch o.c. within 7-inch wide
in. . i ; Min. 0.5-inch thick, . .
sc.107 2/,“; aznzsggjst’ypidBé|2O\AI/(:|Idsstzlill None one or more lavers prelim. attached GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast HD | laps spaced 89-inch o.c. Laps 60.0
’ pans; P ore 1avers, ’ TPO Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat '
o.c. any combination
weld.
:fg;-zsz' ia;r:ZP:/Z:’GT:;:i/eld Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
SC-108. . .p 4 p None one or more layers, Prelim. attached TPO (min. 60- | Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps -60.0
6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural L . . .
any combination mil) GenFast HD Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete
Min. 22’ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ . .
SC-109. X . None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) laps spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps -60.0
o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural o TPO i . .
any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33
steel; 6 s.pans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
o.c. or Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi . TPO or EZ . .
SC-110. i ” None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps -67.5
steel; 6’ spans; 5/8” puddle . Fleece Backed . R .
” . . any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
welds 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi TPO
structural concrete
Min. 22'ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 6-inch o.c. Wlth!n 6-inch wide
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ . laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps
SC-111. ) . None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) | . -82.5
o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - TPO ) sealed with 5-inch heat weld
any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates
concrete that encapsulates plates.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020

GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Appendix 1, Page 16 of 44




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2E: STEEL oR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (STRESS PLATES)

System Deck . . Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
Vapor & Air Barrier
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 3-inch GenFlex Note 2 (HD only) 1
Min. 22 ga., type B, 60 ksi steel; Two (2) layers, GenFlex I1SO, GenFlex Coated per 5.3 ft? . 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide
GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fast th GenFast HD
SC-112. | 6 spans; #12-24 x1-1/4” HWH | Vapor Shield with min. 3- | Glass Facer or 24x36-inch grid, T:g X S::ma;Iates asteners with Genras laps spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps 825
screw 6” o.c. inch side laps self-adhered GenFlex HD 12-inch from sealed with 1.5-inch heat weld.
Composite 1SO board edges
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 . S .
steel or min. 20 ga., type B, Min. 1.5-inch thick, GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or 6-inch o.c. W'th!n E-inch wide
A . GenFlex EZ . laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps
SC-113. Grade 33 steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 None one or more layers, Prelim. attached GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) R . -90.0
” R . L TPO . sealed with 5-inch heat weld
screw 6” o.c. min. 2,500 psi any combination with GenFast HD Plus Seam Plates
that encapsulates plates.
structural concrete

TABLE 2F: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (BATTENS)

e Deck Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Notes 15 & 17) MDP
stem No.
Y (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22 ga,, t B, Grade 33
n ,ga » ype b, Grade ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or Fasteners 12-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 Prelim. GenFlex EZ R . . . .
SC-114. X X one or more layers, GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld -45.0
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural L attached TPO R
any combination GenFast Polymer Batten Strip that encapsulates batten.
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, prelim GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or Fasteners 12-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide
SC-115. steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6” one or more layers, ) GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) with laps spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld -45.0
X R - attached TPO X
o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor that encapsulates batten.
concrete
Firestone UltraPly QuickSeam R.M.A. Strips are applied over
Min. 22[ga., type B, Grade 33 ; Min. 1.5-inch thick, ) Firestone UltraPly QuickSeam R.M.A. Strips the |nsu|at|or? spaced 120-inch -o.c. The batten is centered
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 Prelim. GenFlex EZ . . over each strip and fastened 6-inch o.c. Roof cover
SC-116. ) . one or more layers, with GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast . ) - 5 R -45.0
o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination attached TPO Coiled Bar Anchor adhered to each strip by first priming with Firestone
concrete Y UltraPly TPO QuickPrime at the strip location, then rolling
into place with a hand roller.
Min. 22’ga., type B, Grade 80 " Min. 1.5-inch thick, . ) Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast Coiled Bar . R .
SC-117. X . one or more layers, Loose Laid spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -52.5
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - TPO Anchor
any combination encapsulates batten.
concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast Concrete Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten in field of the roof
h ,, Prelim. GenFlex EZ R . . ) . .
SC-118. steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, attached 0 Drive (concrete only) with GenFlex Bar Anchor | spaced 144-inch o.c. Battens sealed with 5-inch wide cover -60.0
o.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination or GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor strip, with 1.5-inch heat weld on each side of the strip.
concrete

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 17 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 2F: STEEL orR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF) orR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (BATTENS)

NEmoO | etc.

S Deck Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Notes 15 & 17) MDP
stem No.
v (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast Concrete Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
) \ Prelim. GenFlex EZ R . R . .
SC-119. steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, attached 0 Drive (concrete only) with GenFast Polymer spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -60.0
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination Batten Strips encapsulates batten.
concrete
Min. 22[ ga., type B, Grade 33 ; Min. 1.5-inch thick, prelim. GenElex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with Fasteners 6».|nch o.c. through batter-1 W|th|n 6-inch wide laps
SC-120. steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, . spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -60.0
- attached TPO GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor
o.c. any combination encapsulates batten.
Min. 22'ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast Concrete Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 Prelim. GenFlex EZ . | . . . .
SC-121. X . one or more layers, Drive (concrete only) with GenFast Coiled Bar spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -67.5
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - attached TPO .
any combination Anchor or GenFast Polymer Batten Strip encapsulates batten.
concrete
Min. 22'ga., type B, Grade 33 ; Min. 1.5-inch thick, prelim. GenElex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with Fasteners 6—.|nch o.c. through batter'1 W|tr.1|n 6-inch wide laps
SC-122. steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, . spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -67.5
- attached TPO GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor
o.c. any combination encapsulates batten.
Min. 22 ga, type 8, Grade 80 secl Drive (concrete ony) ith Gen i ar Anchor
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, . . v Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
8 " Prelim. GenFlex EZ or GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor or GenFast HD . . .
SC-123. steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -75.0
X . - attached TPO Plus Fasteners (steel only) or GenFast
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination R . encapsulates batten.
Concrete Drive (concrete only) with GenFast
concrete .
Polymer Batten Strip
Min. 22, ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Plus Fast.eners (steel only) or. Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
sc-124 steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more lavers Prelim. GenFlex EZ GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) with spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps sealed with S-inch heat weld that 825
' 0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - Vers, attached TPO GenFlex Bar Anchor or GenFast Coiled Bar P ¢ Lap :
any combination encapsulates batten.
concrete Anchor
Min. 22[ ga., type B, Grade 80 § Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with Fasteners E-i-mch o.c. through battc.en W|Fh|n 6-inch wide laps
SC-125. steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, Loose Laid . . spaced 68-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -82.5
- TPO GenFast % in. Polymer Batten Strips
o.c. any combination encapsulates battens.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel . . . . TR .
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, Prelim. GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast Coiled Bar Fasteners 6 inch o.c. through battc.en WIFhm E-inch wide laps
SC-126. ) " one or more layers, spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -90.0
steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 - attached TPO Anchor
oc any combination encapsulates batten.
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel
or min. 20 ga., type B, Grade 33 Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Plus Fast.eners (steel only) orv Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
, " Prelim. GenFlex EZ GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) with ; ) X
SC-127. steel; 6’ spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, ) spaced 90-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -97.5
X . - attached TPO GenFlex Bar Anchor or GenFast Coiled Bar
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural any combination Anchor encapsulates batten.
concrete
Min. 22, ga., type B, Grade 33 ” Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) or Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 Prelim. GenFlex EZ R . . X .
SC-128. X R one or more layers, GenFast Concrete Drive (concrete only) with spaced 54-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -112.5
0.c. min. 2,500 psi structural - attached TPO X
concrete any combination GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor encapsulates batten.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 18 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 2F: STEEL oR STRUCTURAL CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TeAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (BATTENS)

S Deck Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Notes 15 & 17) MDP
stem No.
v (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Min. 0.5-inch
DensDeck, DensDeck
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 Prime or S.ECUROCK . . Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through batten within 6-inch wide laps
3 ” Gypsum-Fiber Roof Prelim. GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with . . X
SC-129. steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 . . spaced 54-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch heat weld that -112.5
Board loose laid over | attached TPO GenFast Coiled Bar Anchor
o.c. . . ) encapsulates batten.
min. 1.5-inch thick,
one or more layers,
any combination
Lap Row: Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through battens within 6-
inch wide laps spaced 142-inch o.c. Laps sealed with 5-inch
in. . in. 1.5-i i heat Id that lates the batten.
Min 22’ga , type B, Grade 80 : Min. 1.5-inch thick, . GenFlex EZ GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with .ea we a encapsu.a es the batten .
SC-130. steel; 6" spans; Traxx/5 screw 6 one or more layers, Loose Laid . . Field Row: Fasteners 6-inch o.c. through battens in one -135.0
- TPO GenFast % in. Polymer Batten Strips . . . .
o.c. any combination intermediate row between laps. Batten strips covered with
5-inch wide GenFlex EZ TPO strips sealed on both sides with
1.5-inch heat weld.
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 19 of 44



TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

NEmoO | etc.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS
Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2, i . . . . . . Flex EZ TP EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
C-1 in. 2,500 psi ASTM D41 with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.5-inch Firestone FiberTop Hot Asphalt GenFlex o/ oc -135.0*
structural concrete 1168
GenFlex ISO
Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
C-2 in- & pst ASTM D41 or GenFlex Coated Glass Hot Asphalt (Optional) Tapered GenFlex ISO Hot asphalt enriex / ! -180.0*
structural concrete 1168
Facer
. . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO . . .
c-3 Min. 2,500 psi ASTM D41 | with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.25-inch DensD‘eck, DensDeck Prime or Hot Asphalt GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -195.0*
structural concrete SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
GenFlex ISO
. . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO . . .
c-4 Min. 2,500 psi ASTM D41 | with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Hot Asphalt GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -195.0%
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
GenFlex ISO
. . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Cc-5 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -165.0*
structural concrete 1168, LVOC-BA
Facer
. . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
C-6 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -240.0*
structural concrete 1168
Facer
in. 2 i . . . . L. . . . EZ EZ-BA, L -BA-
c-7 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. GenFlex EZTPO / A, LVOC-BA -285.0%
structural concrete 1168
Min. 2, i Min. 1.5-inch FI
C-8 in- 2,500 psi None in. 1.5-inch GenFlex G-OSIA (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P -165.0%*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
c-9 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. | (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, WBBA-P | -240.0*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
in. 2 i in. 1.5-i
Cc-10 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. | (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P 2475
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex . . - . . . GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- «
C-11 structural concrete None Coated Glass Facer G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA, 6-inch o.c. 1168, LVOC-BA -360.0
c-12 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-0SIA Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Glass Facer G-0SIA GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -450.0*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
c-13 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. two layers min. 1.5 | ¢ ) Min. 0.5-inch FiberTop C or § G-0SIA GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 210.0%
structural concrete inch GenFlex 1ISO
c-14 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1O | G-OSIA Min. 0.25—-|nch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-0SIA GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 127.5%
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168
Min. 2, i Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck ECUROCK -Fi
c-15 in. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | G-OSIA in. 0-25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber | )\ GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -157.5*
structural concrete Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 20 of 44




TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

NEmoO | etc.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
c-16 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1SO | G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. Min. 0.25—'|nch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 187.5%
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168
Min. 2, i T | in. 1.5-inch . Min. 0.25-inch D Deck Pri ECUROCK .
c17 in. 2,500 psi None wo layers min. 1.5-inc G-OSIA, 8-inch o.c. in. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROC G-0SIA, 8-inch o.c. GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -195.0*
structural concrete GenFlex ISO Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 2,500 psi . . 1-inch GenFlex ISO or 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex I1SO; *
C-18 structural concrete None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | G-OSIA Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-OSIA GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA-S -240.0
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
c-19 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1SO | G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. Min. 0.25—.|nch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-OSIA, 4-inch o.c. GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 247 5%
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168
€20 Min. 2,500 psi None M|n. two layers min. 1.5- G-OSIA Min. 0.25—.|nch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK G-OSIA GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 2625+
structural concrete inch GenFlex I1ISO Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2 i | in.
c21 in. 2,500 psi None One or more layers, min. | ), Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1SO G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, WBBA-P | -222.5%
structural concrete 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi One or more layers, min. . . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC- «
C-22 structural concrete None 1.5-inch GenElex 1SO G-OSIA Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-0SIA BA-1168 -247.5
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- "
¢23 structural concrete | O e G-OSIA None N/A 1168, WBBA, WBBA-P -300.0
C-24 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | Polyset CR-20 (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -270.0*
structural concrete 1168
in. 2 i . . in. 0.25-i D D E -Fi
c-25 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex1SO | Polyset CR-20 Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber |\ .\ e 5q GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -195.0%
structural concrete Roof Board
Min. 2, i Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Pri ECUROCK Flex EZ TP EZ-BA, LVOC-BA-
C-26 in. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | Polyset CR-20 in. 0.25 -mc ensDeck Prime or SECURO Polyset CR-20 GenFlex o/ ,LVO -240.0*
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168
. . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
c-27 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- -150.0*
structural concrete 1168
Facer
c-28 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P -150.0*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
in. 2 i in. 1.5-i -i ) " . . , 6-i
c-29 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P -247.5*%
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer o.c. o.c.
Min. 2,500 psi . . . - . .
C-30 None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | 1.5.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -270.0%
structural concrete
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch . - . . 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- .
¢31 structural concrete None Coated Glass Facer o.c. (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation o.c. 1168, LVOC-BA -360.0
in. 2 i in. 1-i
c-32 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Glass Facer 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -450.0*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 21 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
c-33 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. two layers min. 1.5- | | ¢ o ek Min. 0.5-inch FiberTop C or $ 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -210.0%
structural concrete inch GenFlex 1ISO
Min. 2,500 psi . . Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or «
C-34 structural concrete None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | 1.S.0. STICK SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 150.0
c-35 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex SO | 1.5.0. STICK Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -150.0*
structural concrete Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 2,500 psi . . 1-inch GenFlex ISO or 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO; *
C-36 structural concrete None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO 1.S.0. STICK Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.S.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA-S 240.0
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
c-37 Min. 2,500 psi None M|n. two layers min. 1.5- 15.0. STICK Min. 0.25—.|nch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 15.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 262.5*
structural concrete inch GenFlex I1ISO Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2 i | in.
38 in. 2,500 psi None One or more layers, min. | | ¢ crjcy Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1SO 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, WBBA-P | -247.5*
structural concrete 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi One or more layers, min. . . GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- *
Cc-39 structural concrete None 1.5-inch GenElex 1SO 1.5.0. STICK Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO 1.5.0. STICK 1168 -300.0
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch . . 1.5.0. STICK, 6-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- .
40 structural concrete None Coated Glass Facer o.c. Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 15O o.c. 1168, LVOC-BA -360.0
) . Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
c-41 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | 1.5.0. STICK 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO/ EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- |, o,
structural concrete . . 1168, LVOC-BA, WBBA, WBBA-P
Facer Coated Glass Facer; Min. 19/32-inch plywood
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- .
42 structural concrete | M€ 150 1.5.0. STICK None N/A 1168, WBBA, WBBA-P -405.0
Min. 2, i Min. 1.5-inch FI 1.5.0. FIX I, 6-inch 1.S.0. FIX I, 6-inch
C-43 in. 2,500 psi None in. 1.5-inch GenFlex 0 , brinc (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation S0 , 6rinc GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P -247.5%
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer o.c. o.c.
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. FIX I, 6-inch . . . . 1.5.0. FIX 1I, 6-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- .
C-44 structural concrete None Coated Glass Facer oc. (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation oc. 1168, LVOC-BA -360.0
c-45 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. FIX Il Min. 1-inch GenFlex Coated Glass Facer 1.5.0. FIX I GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -450.0*
structural concrete Coated Glass Facer
in. 2 i in. in. 1.5- . . .
c-46 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. two layers min. 1.5- | ¢ o ey Min. 0.5-inch FiberTop C or S 1.5.0. FIX II GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 -210.0*
structural concrete inch GenFlex ISO
Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 2,500 psi . . 1-inch GenFlex ISO or 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO; *
c-47 structural concrete None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | 1.S.O. FIX Il Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.S.0. FIX I GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA-S -240.0
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2, i Min. two | in. 1.5- Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Pri ECUROCK
c-48 in. 2,500 psi None Min. two layers min. 1.5 | ¢ 5 gy in. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECURO 1.5.0. FIX I GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA-1168 262.5*
structural concrete inch GenFlex I1ISO Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 22 of 44



TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

NEmoO | etc.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 psi One or more layers, min. . .
C-49 None R 1.S.0. FIX I Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO 1.S.0. FIX I GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, WBBA-P -135.0%
structural concrete 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2, i Min. 0.5-inch Flex HD 1.5.0. FIX II, 4-inch
C-50 in. 2,500 psi None In. 0.5-inch GenFlex 5-0. FIX Il 4-inc None N/A GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, WBBA-P | -135.0%
structural concrete I1SO o.c.
c-51 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1.5.0. FIX I, 4-inch None N/A GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- 247 5%
structural concrete I1SO o.c. 1168
C-52 Min. 2,500 psi None One or more layers, min. | | ¢ 5 gy Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO 1.5.0. FIX I GenFlex EZTPO /EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- | 5 o
structural concrete 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO 1168
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1.5.0. FIX II, 6-inch . . 1.5.0. FIX II, 6-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA, LVOC-BA- "
¢33 structural concrete None Coated Glass Facer o.c. Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO o.c. 1168, LVOC-BA -360.0
Min. 2,500 psi Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1.5.0. FIX Il, 4-inch
C-54 . £,500 ps! None n. B.>-ineh Genrlex s ine None N/A GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA -360.0*
structural concrete I1SO o.c.
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS IN XR BONDING ADHESIVE
. . Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
c-55 Min. 2,500 psi ASTM D41 | Prime or SECUROCK Hot Asphalt None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -232.5*
structural concrete . EZ-FBBA
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 psi One or two layers min. Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / «
56 structural concrete ASTM D41 1.5-inch GenFlex I1ISO Hot Asphalt Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Hot Asphalt EZ-FBBA 300.0
. . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min.
Min. 2, Flex EZ FI Backed TP
c-57 in. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-0SIA; 15.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / 112.5%
structural concrete EZ-FBBA
Facer Glass Facer
. . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 2,500 . GenFlex EZ Fl Backed TPO
c-58 st:zctural Cgf]'crete None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-0SIA; 1.5.0. STICK E;—T:B;: eece backe / -390.0*
Facer Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / "
€59 structural concrete | N°M® E;C(::nFlex Coated Glass G-0sIA Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck G-OSIA EZ-FBBA -300.0
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / *
60 structural concrete None E;C(::nFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck 1.5.0. STICK EZ-FBBA -187.5
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS IN HOT ASPHALT
Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
in. 2 . . ! EZ B
c-61 Min. 2,500 psi (Optional) | o o SECUROCK Hot Asphalt None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -232.5*
structural concrete ASTM D41 ; Hot Asphalt
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 23 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

NEmoO | etc.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 psi (Optional) . . . - . . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / "
C-62 structural concrete ASTM D41 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO | Hot asphalt (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation Hot asphalt Hot Asphalt -300.0
Min. 2, i . . Flex EZ FI Backed TP
c-63 in. 2,500 psi ASTM D41 | Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex SO | Hot Asphalt None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -382.5%
structural concrete Hot Asphalt
c-64 Min. 2,500 psi None Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 1SO | Hot Asphalt None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -487.5*
structural concrete Hot Asphalt
Min. 2,500 psi (Optional) . . Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / "
65 structural concrete ASTM D41 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlexISO | Hot Asphalt Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Hot Asphalt Hot Asphalt 457.5
Min. 2,500 psi (Optional) Two layers min. 1.5-inch Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / "
66 structural concrete ASTM D41 GenFlex I1SO Hot Asphalt Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Hot Asphalt Hot Asphalt 3000
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO /
- Fl | - - -390.0*
c67 structural concrete None ?;:;n ex Coated Glass G-OSIA Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck G-OSIA Hot Asphalt 390.0
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / N
c-68 structural concrete None ;);ie;nFIex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck 1:5.0. STICK Hot Asphalt -187.5
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS IN XR STICK:
. . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min.
C-69 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-08IA; 1.5.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / 1425+
structural concrete XR Stick, 12-inch o.c.
Facer Glass Facer
) . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min.
c-70 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-08IA; 1.5.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / 172.5%
structural concrete XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. (full coverage)
Facer Glass Facer
) . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
c71 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-0SIA; 1.5.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / 45,0
structural concrete . X XR Stick, 12-inch o.c.
Facer Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
) . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
.2 . EZ B.
c-72 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; I1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-0SIA; 1.5.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -82.5*
structural concrete . . XR Stick, 6-inch o.c.
Facer Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
.2 . EZ B.
c-73 x;:ctéfgocz:crete None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK g:';i::lf 4_iiljfzec ?leifgot/zcr)a/ o | 1725
Facer Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO ! - &
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi . 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / "
C74 structural concrete None ;);ie;nFIex Coated Glass G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck G-0SIA; 1.5.0. STICK XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. 45.0
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 24 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 3A: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER
REFER TO NOTE 16 FOR VAPOR BARRIER OPTIONS.

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck . MDP
Primer Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi . 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / .
¢75 structural concrete None g;c(::nFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. -60.0
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
. . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO
Min. 2,500 psi . 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / .
c76 structural concrete None g;c(::nFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. (full coverage) 1725
Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
) . Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min.
c-77 Min. 2,500 psi None or GenFlex Coated Glass | G-OSIA; 1.5.0. STICK | 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated G-08lA; 15.0. sTick | GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO / -45.0%
structural concrete . . XR Stick, 12-inch o.c.
Facer Glass Facer followed by min. 19/32-inch plywood

TABLE 3B: CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck i
Primer MDP
No. (Note 1) Base Ply Application Top Ply Application (psf)

c78 Min. 2,500 psi structural None None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. 97.5*
concrete

c79 Min. 2,500 psi structural None None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | EZ-FBBA -360.0*
concrete

c-80 Min. 2,500 psi structural None None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. -150.0*
concrete

c-81 Min. 2,500 psi structural ASTMD41 | None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | EZ-FBBA -180.0*
concrete

c-82 Min. 2,500 psi structural ASTM D41 One or two plies GenFlex Type IV or Type YI or one ply of Firestone MB Hot asphalt GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. 315.0%
concrete Base, SBS Base, SBS PolyBase or SBS Premium Base
Min. 2, i |

c-83 in. 2,500 psi structura None None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | Hot asphalt -487.5*
concrete

C-84 Min. 2,500 psi structural ASTM D41 None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO | Hot asphalt -495.0*
concrete

NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 25 of 44



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Coverboard MDP
ec
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 Eﬂg:cfestz Sfi'{hmc'zici_:zcﬁstgffofslcoﬁo'\g; Ci:””'ar Min. Linch Genflex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-1 psi structural . . . . gY ving ’ G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -217.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO 150 BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 Eﬂg:cfestz Sfi'{hmc'zici_:zcﬁst:;f:ofslcoﬁo'\g; Ci:””'ar Min. Linch Genflex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-2 psi structural . . . . gY ving : G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -217.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer Coated Glass Facer BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
. Lo . . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Eﬂo':cfestz r;fi'éhmc'ziciﬁzcﬁstgf:offlcoﬁo?; ?:””'ar inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-3 | psistructural : e heology ving ISO or Tapered G-0SIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite 1SO G-0SIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- 217.5+
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey
concrete ) . GenFlex Coated Glass BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Min 2,500 | G e S Rheology Modifyng | Min:1:3nch GenFlex Ieulaion o min. 0.5 nch Tapered Genflex GenFlex E2TPO/ EZ-BA,
: ) ’ .0. i A . B "
LWe-4 Ecs’lns;trreutitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ggszrg:::lex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed G-OSIA Ié\/:OC BA-1168, LVOC 217:5
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. - . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Eﬂo':c?:tz “;Isi't'hmc'zI‘cir';'ﬂ'stg';:ocls'c";:o'\g; Ci:”“'ar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-5 psi structural : . . R gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -217.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey R . .
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or BA
i g P : SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Gertec 2190 754,
LWC-6 | psistructural : _ ' neology ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | G-OSIA -0 P G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- 217.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 19/32-inch plywood
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 pst, min. Z-inch thick Celcore M.F (.Zellular ) . (Optional) Additional layer of base
LWC-7 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / 45.0*
’c)oncrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO 150 o P WBBA, WBBA-P ’
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 ps, min. Z-inch thick Celcore M.F (.:eIIuIar . . (Optional) Additional layer of base
LWC-8 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA GenFlex EZ TPO / 217.5*
P Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer T P WBBA, WBBA-P ’
concrete . A Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
) Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular .(Opt|onal) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZTPO /
g A 5 . . ) ) «
LWC-9 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO or Tapered G-OSIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA WBBA, WBBA-P 135.0
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 26 of 44



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Coverboard MDP
ec|
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 pS'I, min. 2-inch thick Celcore M'F (;eIIuIar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 'Optlon'al addmf)nal Iayers of base
LWC-10 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying 1O or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / 135.0*
Soncrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed WBBA, WBBA-P ’
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. Lo . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Eﬂc;:‘c?est(()e r\;/silt’thIZI.czo_rlzCl-rl]st;::o(l:slcol:/leo’\;ii (i2:IIuIar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ TPO /
LWC-11 psi structural . . . . gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | G-OSIA -135.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey K . ) WBBA, WBBA-P
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
J J P : SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 ?g:c?:tz ‘\;’Si't'hmc'zl'czo'r'zﬂ'st;;f:ocl?c";:o'\d"; Ci:””'ar Min. Linch Genflex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-12 psi structural . . . . gY ving ’ 1.S.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO 150 BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 ?g:c?:tz “;lsi't'hmézI'ci'r'zﬂ'st;:f:ocls'c"':ﬂeo'\gii Cis”“'ar Min. Linch Genflex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-13 psi structural ) . . R gY ving : 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer Coated Glass Facer BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore, Elastizell Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layers of base
LWC-14 | psi structural - <10 pst, min. ’ ' o 1.5.0.STICK | - PHor v 1.5.0. STICK GenFlexEZTPO /EZBA | -225.0*
Mearlcrete or Insulcel cellular LWIC. I1SO insulation
concrete
. Lo . . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 2"0':;;2 ‘\;Isi't'hmc'zl‘cir'z‘:'st;';gocls'c";ﬂeo'\g; Ci:”“'ar inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-15 | psi structural ! ) Leleor neclogy Wloditying ISO or Tapered 1.5.0.STICK | Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite 15O 15.0.STICK | LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Gerls 270 2.2,
LWC-16 | psi structural : _ ' neology ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | 1.5.0. STICK -0 P 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. R . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Eﬂo':c?:tz s:i't'hmc'gl‘cir'gﬂ'st;;fgocls'c";:o'\d"; Ci:”“'ar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
LWC-17 psi structural : . . R gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey R . .
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or BA
i g P : SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore, Elastizell Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
LWC-1 i structural : P ’ ’ ) EZ EZ-B -225.0*
we-18 E:nscrreuti ura Mearlcrete or Insulcel cellular LWIC. ISO 1.5.0. STICK SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / A 5.0

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 27 of 44




TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

- P Base Insulation Layer Coverboard o
ec|
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Gerts 210062
LWC-19 | psi structural : e neology ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | 1.5.0. STICK - P 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC- -187.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed BA
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 19/32-inch plywood
Min. 2,500 2/'0':-;;(; lilsilt,hm(;zI'czo_rlz:]St:::ocl:jlgcyolzlleo’\;iiy(i::gmar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZTPO /
- . . - . . . i ~ *
LWC-20 Szlr]s;trg[itural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey 150 1.5.0. STICK :gts)ulatlon or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK WBBA, WBBA-P 45.0
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 2/'0':-;;(; lilsilt,hm(;zI.czo_rlzcl:]st:::o(l:slgcyolzlleo’\éliiy(i:::mar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZTPO /
- . . - . . . i _ *
LWC-21 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Coated Glass Facer 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK WBBA, WBBA-P 187.5
concrete X . Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
) Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular .(Opt|onal) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZTPO /
. ) . . . .
LWC-22 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO or Tapered 1.5.0. STICK Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO 1.5.0. STICK WBBA, WBBA-P 135.0
concrete ) ) GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
—
_ ) .0.5- ) N
twe23 EZ'nsctr;“tit“'a' Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey gggg:::'ex Coated | 15.0-STICK 1 150 or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | "0~ ST | wpga, wesa-p 1330
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. R . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:.c?est(t)a F\;:ilt’hm(‘_IZI.cirlg?St;::o(ljslcolzﬂeo’\gii (ii:llular Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ TPO /
LWC-24 psi structural : . . R gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | 1.5.0. STICK -135.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . K R WBBA, WBBA-P
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
i g P ’ SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 ps, min. Z-inch thick Celcore M.F (.:eIIuIar . . (Optional) Additional layer of base
LWC-25 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tanered GenFlex | G-OSIA GenFlex EZ Fleece 112.5%
’c)oncrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO 150 o P Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 ps, min. Z-inch thick Celcore M.F (.Zellular . . (Optional) Additional layer of base
LWC-26 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tanered GenFlex | G-OSIA GenFlex EZ Fleece 142.5%
P Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer T P Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
concrete . A Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
) Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular .(Opt|onal) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
. ) 3 Lo . ) ) *
LWC-27 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO or Tapered G-OSIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA 217.5
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 28 of 44



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

G Sl Base Insulation Layer Coverboard MDP
ec|
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 pS'I, min. 2-inch thick Celcore M'F (;eIIuIar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex 'Optlon'al addmf)nal Iayers of base
LWC-28 si structural Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying 1O or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex G-OSIA GenFlex EZ Fleece 217.5+
Soncrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. - . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Eﬂc;:‘c?estz F\;/Silt’hméZI.czo_rlzCl-rl]st;::o(l:slcol:/leo’\;ii (i2:IIuIar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-29 psi structural . . . . gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | G-OSIA -217.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey K . ) Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
e i P : SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:‘c?est(()e r\;lsilt’thIZI.ci_rlzi—:]st;::oclslcol:/leo’\gii Ci:”u'ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-30 psi structural . . X R gY ving ' G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -142.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey I1SO 150 12-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. o
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:;:?est(t)e r\;vsilt’hmclzI.czo:(re]CI-:]St:Ihctl:ocl::ICOI:/Ieo’\cgli:Z Ci:”u'ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-31 psi structural A . . R gY ving : G-OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -142.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Coated Glass Facer .
concrete - ) Coated Glass Facer 12-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
. Lo . . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:.c?est(t)a F\;:ilt’hm(‘_IZI.cirlg?St;::oclslcolzjo’\élii (ii:llular inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-32 psi structural ) . . R gY ying ISO or Tapered G-OSIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey .
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass 12-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Gerles 2 e
LWC-33 psi structural ) . X R gY ving ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA o P G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 12-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO -
. Lo . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.cfeiz ‘\jvsilt’thIZI.ci-rlz?St;::o(lzslcolzjo,\gi: (ii:llular Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-34 psi structural . X . . gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA I1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . A A .
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or 12-inch o.c.
E g Lompaund. SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.cfeiz ’\j\/silt’hm(ilZI.ci-:Z?Stg;f:ofslcolzjohji: (i::”war Min. 1-inch GenFlex azz'g:ﬂnagfﬁ:?nnaé I:\i/rf;?l'fabzsr‘Zd GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-35 | psi structural : A ' neclogy ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | G-OSIA o P G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 12-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 19/32-inch plywood -
. - ) . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. . 2-inch thick Cel MF Cellul
Min. 2,500 Cc::cfeiz ‘\jvsilt’thIZIco:ZiiS R:eols Col:/Todif i: utar inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-36 | psi structural : A _ neclogy ving ISO or Tapered G-OSIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -82.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey .
concrete ) ) GenFlex Coated Glass 6-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 29 of 44




TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

- P Base Insulation Layer Coverboard o
ec|
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Gerles 7l
LWC-37 | psi structural : . ' neology ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | G-OSIA o P G-OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -82.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 6-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO o
. Lo . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 pS'I, min. 2-inch thick Celcore M,F (;ellular Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
. Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying .
LWC-38 psi structural R . . . ) ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed G-0OSIA Backed TPO / XR Stick, -60.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey K . ) .
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or 6-inch o.c.
g e P ’ SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:‘c?est(()e r\;lsilt’thIZI.ci_rlzi—:]st;::oclslcol:/leo’\gii Ci:”l”ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base (B;aeg:ZxTizoF}e)f;eStick
LWC-39 psi structural . . . R gY ving ' G-0OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA . ’ -172.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | 1SO 1SO 4-inch o.c. (full
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. coverage)
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lol:‘c?est(()e r\;vsilt’hmclzI.czo:(re]CI-:]St:Ihctl:ocl::ICOI:/Ieo’\cgli:Z Ci:”u'ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base (B;aeg:ZxTizoF}e;;eStick
LWC-40 psi structural . . . R gY ving : G-0OSIA insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | G-OSIA . ’ -172.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Coated Glass Facer 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete - A Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. coverage)
) Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular .(Opt|onal) Min. 0.5- GenFlex EZ Fleece
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifyin inch Tapered GenFlex Backed TPO / XR Stick,
LWC-41 | psi structural : _ ' neology ying SO or Tapered G-0SIA Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO G-OSIA . g 172.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer coverage)
00 e g | i 1nch Gens s el et
LWC-42 i - o - ’ -172.5%
We-4 ?;Lsctrzitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Iégscslerce:rFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed G-OSIA 4-inch o.c. (full 725
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO coverage)
. Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular . . .Optlon.al addm?nal IaYers of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifvin Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex Backed TPO / XR Stick
LWC-43 psi structural A . . R gY ving ISO or GenFlex Coated G-OSIA 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | G-OSIA . ’ -172.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . A A 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or coverage)
e g Lompaund. SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board g
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.cfeiz svsilt,hmclzI.cf)-rlzﬂst;;f:o(lzjlgcyol:/leo,\;iiy(i::gUIar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
. . L 1- ) ; ; » R *
LWC-44 ;Cazlnsctrlgitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey SO 1.5.0. STICK :gts)ulatlon or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA 112.5
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.c?eig ’\)/:ilt,hmclzI.cf)-rlz?St;;f:o(lzjlgcyo;o,\c;liiy(i::gular Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
_ . . -~ . . . i _ *
LWC-45 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Coated Glass Facer 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA 142.5
concrete . . Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 30 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

- P Base Insulation Layer Coverboard o
ec
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
) Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular .(Opt|onal) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
g ) R . ) *
LWC-46 psi structural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO or Tapered 1.5.0. STICK Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA 187.5
concrete ) ) GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Min. 2,500 !\:/'0':-;’;2 r\tilt’hmclzI.ci_rlzcl—:]St:::oclslgcyol:/leo’\éliiy?:gular Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ﬁzzg:ﬂnag?l:r:ionnatl) ?xs(:;fal;":e:d GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
g . .0. . *
LWC-47 Ecs’lns;trreutitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ggszrg:::lex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA 187.5
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO
. - . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 !\:Aol:‘c?est(()e r\;/silt’thIZI.cirlzClj]st;::o(lzslcolzﬂeo’\gii (i2:IIuIar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-48 psi structural . . X R gY ying ISO or GenFlex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | 1.5.0. STICK -187.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . : ) Backed TPO / EZ-FBBA
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
J J P : SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 !\:/lol:‘c?est(()e r\;lsilt’thIZI.ci_rlzi—:]st;::oclslcol:/leo’\gii (i2:IIuIar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-49 psi structural ; . . R gY ving ’ 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -142.5*
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey I1SO 10 12-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. o
Min. 2,500 ?ZAOI:.c?eSt(t)a ‘\:\f)ilt’hm(‘_lgl.ci-rlg?St;;fgo(lzslcolzjo,\;ii (ii:llular Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-50 psi structural K X . . gY ying ; 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -142.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer A
concrete . A Coated Glass Facer 12-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound.
. - ) . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.cfeiz ’\jvsilt’thIZI.cirIZ?Stg;f:ofslcoﬁohji: (iZ:IIuIar inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-51 | psi structural : . ' neclogy ving SO or Tapered 1.5.0.STICK | Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite 1SO 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey A
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass 12-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Min. 2,500 ?Z/lc::.cfeiz ’\j\/silt’hm(ilZI.ci-:Z?Stg;f:ofslcolzjohgi: (i::”mar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex azz'g:ﬂnagfﬁ:?nnaé I:\i/rf;?l'fabzsreed GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-52 | psi structural : A _ neclogy ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | 1.5.0. STICK o P 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Glass Facer 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 12-inch o.c
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO -
. Lo . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. . 2-inch thick Cel MF Cellul
Min. 2,500 Cc::cfeiz ‘\jvsilt’thIZIcorIZi-lS thceolcf COI:/Ieodif i: ufar Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-53 | psi structural : | ereor neclogy ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | 1.5.0.STICK | ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -45.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . A . .
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or 12-inch o.c.
g g Lompound. SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
n. min. 240 - . . - —
Min 2500 | icore HS Rheology wodifyng. | M- 1-ineh GenFlex Inulaion o min. 0.5 nch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ leece
- i < YT i - *
LWC-54 S:nsctrrellcetural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ggssz(:s:rFlex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 1:5.0. STICK ?;_CII;EC(:] LPCO / XR stick, 45.0
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 19/32-inch plywood -

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 31 of 44



TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

- P Base Insulation Layer Coverboard o
ec
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
. Lo . . (Optional) Min. 0.5-
Min. 2,500 Eﬂc;:‘c?estz F\;/Silt’hméZI.czorlzCl-rl]st;::o(l:slcol:/leo’\;ii (i2:IIuIar inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
LWC-55 | psistructural : e heology ving ISO or Tapered 1.5.0.STICK | Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite ISO 1.5.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -82.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey .
concrete - A GenFlex Coated Glass 6-inch o.c.
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer
Gt 2 e
_ ) .0. ) } *
LWC-56 Ecs’lns;trreutitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ggszrg:::lex Coated 15.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 1.5.0. STICK giiiido-rfo / XR stick, 82.5
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO o
. - . . Optional additional layers of base
Min. 2,500 Min. 350 pS.I, min. 2-inch thick Celcore M_F (}ellular Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex GenFlex EZ Fleece
) Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying .
LWC-57 psi structural K X . . . ISO or GenFlex Coated 1.S.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 1.S.0. STICK Backed TPO / XR Stick, -60.0*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey A R . Rk
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or 6-inch o.c.
J J P ’ SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 2,500 !\:/'0':-;’;2 r\;lsilt’thIZI.ci_rlzi—:]st;::oclslcol:/leo’\gii Ci:”u'ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base (B;aeg:ZxTizoF}e)f;eStick
LWC-58 | psi structural : . ' neology ying : 1.5.0.STICK | insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK _ g 172.5%
concrete Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey ISO 150 4-inch o.c. (full
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. coverage)
Min. 2,500 2/'0':-0?::; ‘\::ilt’hm(‘_lgl.ci-rlg?St;;::o(lzslco;:o’\élii (i::llu'ar Min. 1-inch GenFlex (Optional) Additional layer of base gae:lftledXTizOF}e)Z:eStick
LWC-59 psi structural A . . R gY ving ; 1.5.0. STICK insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex | 1.5.0. STICK . ! -172.5%
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey | Coated Glass Facer 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete . A Coated Glass Facer
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. coverage)
. Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular _(Opt'°nal) Min. 0.5- GenFlex EZ Fleece
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifyin inch Tapered GenFlex Backed TPO / XR Stick
LWC-60 | psi structural : . ! neology ving SO or Tapered 1.5.0.STICK | Min. 2-inch GenFlex HD Composite 1SO 1.5.0. STICK : d -172.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete . A GenFlex Coated Glass
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. Facer coverage)
20 | 1 2500 2 ks GO i st O e R
| i o ’ B *
LWC-61 ?;Lsctrzitural Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey Iégscslerce:rFlex Coated 1.5.0. STICK 1SO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed 1.5.0. STICK 4-inch o.c. (full 172:5
board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. by min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO coverage)
. Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular . . .Optlon.al addm?nal IaYers of base GenFlex EZ Fleece
Min. 2,500 Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifvin Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex Backed TPO / XR Stick
LWC-62 | psi structural : | ereor neclogy ving ISO or GenFlex Coated | 1.5.0.STICK | ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed | 1.5.0. STICK ! ' -172.5*
Admixture, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey . A ) 4-inch o.c. (full
concrete board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound Glass Facer by Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or coverage)
g g Lompound. SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board g
Min. 2,500
! in. 1.5-i - . - . .
LWC-63 psi structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell cellular LWIC. l'\éllon S-inch GenFlex ZSIyset CR (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 | GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -180.0%
concrete

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 32 of 44




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 4A: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION orR REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

- P Base Insulation Layer Coverboard o
ec|
ystem Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Attach Attach Roof Cover (Note 15)
No. (Note 1) Type Type (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Min. 2,500 . .
LWC-64 psi structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore cellular LWIC. l'\;lg 1.5-inch GenFlex ;glyset CR- (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 | GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -222.5%
concrete
Min. 2,500 . .
LWC-65 psi structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Mearlcrete cellular LWIC. Il\;lg 1.5-inch GenFlex :glyset CR- (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -240.0%
concrete
Min. 2,500 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Polyset CR Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK
LWC-66 psi structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell cellular LWIC. o ¥ e Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -180.0*
I1SO 20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
concrete
Min. 2,500 Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore or Mearlcrete Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Polyset CR Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK
LWC-67 | psi structural - <00 psl, min. o ¥ - 0.e>! Polyset CR-20 | GenFlex EZTPO/EZ-BA | -195.0*
cellular LWIC. ISO 20 Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
concrete
Min. 2,500
S . Lo . . ) Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Polyset CR- Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
- | . .24 . X - - -180.0*
LWC-68 psi structura Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell cellular LWIC SO 2 SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 | GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA 180.0
concrete
Min. 2,500
S ) - ) ) Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Polyset CR- Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or *
LWC-69 psi structural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore cellular LWIC. IS0 20 SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -222.5
concrete
Min. 2,500 Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex Polyset CR Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or
g ) . S o . . 1.5 - .0.25- 2 : B "
LWC-70 ;c):nsctrreutztural Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Mearlcrete cellular LWIC. 150 20 SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 240.0

TABLE 4B: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION, REROOF (TEAR-OFF) oR RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (THROUGH LWC TO ENGAGE STRUCTURAL DECK)

System Deck (Note 1) Lightweight Insulation (Note 13) Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
eck (Note
No. Concrete (Note 14) Type Attach Membrane Fasteners (Note 11) Attachment (psf)
in. 22 ga. B .59 .
M!n ga’, type BY (c,),SA))' 60 . Lo (Optional) One or more . GenFast HD Fasteners or GenFast Fastened through to engage structural deck, 6-
ksi steel; 5’ spans, 5/8” puddle Min. 200 psi, min. 2- N Prelim. GenFlex EZ . i X . . i
LWC-71 welds 6 o.c. or structural inch thick Elastizell layers, any combination, Attach 70 Concrete Drive (concrete only) with inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps spaced 114- -45.0
- min. 0.5-inch GenFast HD Seam Plates inch o.c. and sealed with a 1.5-inch heat weld.
concrete
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 33 of 44



TABLE 4C: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

Sy’:::em Deck (Note 1) Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Roof Cover (Note 15) I(Vr:stl)’
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS:
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at
LWC-72 max. 6 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 Pre-existent Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick cellular LWIC with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board. GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -67.5%
psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Pre-existent Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick cellular LWIC with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board. When
LWC-73 max. 5 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 walkable, LWC is mechanically attached with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Plates with GenFast HD Fasteners at a density GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -135.0%
psi structural concrete of 1 per 2.0 ft%
. . Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with M
LWC-74 Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 247.5
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS:
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at
LWC-75 max. 6 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore cellular LWIC with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board. ?:SF/I?(ZEFZBI";Izece Backed -45.0*
psi structural concrete
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 200 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore cellular LWIC with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board. When walkable, GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
LWC-76 max. 6 ft spans; 5/8” puddle welds with washer 6” LWC is mechanically attached with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Plates with GenFast HD Fasteners at a density of 1 per 2.0 TPO / EZ-FBBA -90.0*
0.c. or min. 2,500 psi structural concrete ft2
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Pre-existent Ml'n. 250 p5|,' min. 2-inch thlcl.< cellular LWIS with optional '1—|nch th|ck,'1.0 pcf EPS holey board. When '
LWC-77 max. 6 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” o.c. or min. 2,500 walkable, LWC is mechanically attached with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Plates with GenFast HD Fasteners at a density GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 75.0%
S pans; - o of 1 per 2.0 ft2. Note: To qualify the LWIC under this assembly, a Trufast FM-90 Fastener shall achieve a MCRF of 100 Ibf TPO / EZ-FBBA '
psi structural concrete
when tested per TAS 105.
. . Pre-existent Min. 250 psi, min. 2-inch thick cellular LWIC. Note: To qualify the LWIC under this assembly, a Trufast FM-90 GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed *
LWC-78 | Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Fastener shall achieve a MCRF of 95 Ibf when tested per TAS 105. TPO / EZ-FBBA 467.5
in. 22 ga. B . L . . . . . .
LWC-79 m;’; 6 ftgs 'at:Sp_es/é,,GriiZIf’x:g::/;f::iiﬁ:‘tsu Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 57 5%
oc ’ pans; P optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
LWC-80 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed -60.0*
max. 6 ft spans; Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
LWC-81 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 82.5%
max. 5 ft spans; Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
LWC-82 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 300 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell Lightweight Insulating Concrete, with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 82.5%
max. 6 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” o.c. board. TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
LWC-83 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed -90.0*
max. 4 ft spans; Traxx/5 screws 6” o.c. optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. TPO / EZ-FBBA ’
Min. i, min. 2-inch thick Cel MF Cellular C te with Cel HS Rheol Modifying Admixt ith
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at |n. 350 p?" min . fnch thick Le core eliutar oncr.e e with Celcore HS .eo ogy Modifying Admixture, wi . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
LWC-84 max. 6 ft spans; Tek/5 screws 6” 0.c optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. When walkable, LWC is TPO / EZ-FBBA -90.0*
’ pans; o mechanically attached with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Plates with GenFast HD Fasteners at a density of 1 per 2.0 ft2.
. . Min. 350 psi, min. 2-inch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concrete with Celcore HS Rheology Modifying Admixture, with GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
LWC- .2 . . . . . -90.0*
WC-85 Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. TPO / EZ-FBBA 90.0

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 34 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017




NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 4C: LIGHTWEIGHT CONCRETE DECKS - NEW CONSTRUCTION orR REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

Syst MDP
y:l:m Deck (Note 1) Lightweight Concrete (Note 14) Roof Cover (Note 15) (psf)
Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 vented steel deck at Min. 250 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell Range Il Lightweight Insulating Concrete with optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS
” . ” . . . ” R R GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
LWC-86 max. 6 ft spans; 5/8” puddle welds with washers 6 holey board. When walkable, LWC is mechanically attached with GenFast 3” Round Insulation Plates with GenFast HD -82.5%
. 2 TPO / EZ-FBBA
o.c. Fasteners at a density of 1 per 2.0 ft2.
Min. 2 i, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell R Il Lightweight Insulati ith 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS hol Flex EZ FI Back
LWC-87 Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete in. 250 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell Range Il Lightweight Insulating Concrete wit inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey GenFlex eece Backed -90.0*
board. TPO / EZ-FBBA
LWC-88 Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete Min. 250 psi, min. 2-inch thick Elastizell Range Il Lightweight Insulating Concrete. No EPS holey board. ?:gljiéingzece Backed -210.0%*
. Lo . . . o . . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
LWC-89 Min. 2,500 psi structural concrete M|n.. 350 p§|, m|n..2—|nch thick Celcore MF Cellular Concr.ete with Celcore HS Rr.leology Modifying Admixture, with TPO / XR Stick; 4-inch o.c. 75.0%
optional 1-inch thick, 1.0 pcf EPS holey board and surfacing of Celcore PVA Curing Compound. (full coverage)

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 35 of 44



NEmoO | etc.

TABLE 5A: CEMENTITIOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS - REROOF (TEAR-OFF)
SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck h h Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attac Type Attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
L . . (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or .
CWF-1. Existing Tectum Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO 1.5.0. STICK SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -45.0
CWF-2. Existing Tectum Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO 1.5.0. STICK (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZTPO / LVOC-BA- -45.0*
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168
Existing Tectum or . . (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or *
CWF-3. Fibroplank Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 52.5
CWE-A. E?(lstlng Tectum or Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 (Optlonal).Mm. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA- 525
Fibroplank Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1168

TABLE 5B: CEMENTITOUS WOOD FIBER DECKS - REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Anchor Sheet Base Insulation Top Insulation
System Deck P pre— AT Roof Cover MDP
ten ac ac
No. Note 1 T as Attach T T Note 15 (psf)
( ) ype (Note 11) ac ype (Notes 6,7,8) ype (Notes 6,7,8) ( )
) . . ) (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch
s SBS Base, SBS . 9-inch o.c. in the min. 2-inch lap . . .
CWF-5. Existing Premium Base, MB Trufast Twin |4 18-inch o.c. in two, equally Min. 1.5-inch 1, ¢ 5 oick DensDeck, DensDeck Prime || ¢ ) o GenFlex EZTPO / -45.0*
Tectum Loc-Nail GenFlex ISO or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber EZ-BA
Base or APP 160 spaced center rows
Roof Board
) . . ) (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch
- SBS Base, SBS . 9-inch o.c. in the min. 2-inch lap . . .
Existing o Trufast Twin R R Min. 1.5-inch DensDeck Prime or GenFlex EZTPO / *
CWF-6. Tectum Premium Base, MB Loc-Nail and 18-inch o.c. in two, equally GenFlex SO 1.5.0. STICK SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168 -45.0
Base or APP 160 spaced center rows
Roof Board
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 36 of 44



NEmoO | etc.
TABLE 6A: GYPSUM DECKS - REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Deck h h Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attac Type Attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS:
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch . - . . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, *
G-1. gypsum plank GenFlex IS0 G-OSIA (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168 165.0
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, N
G-2. gypsum plank GenFlex ISO G-OSIA Roof Board G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168 127.5
63 Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch G-OSIA Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof G-0SIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA 157.5%
gypsum plank GenFlex ISO Board
G-4. Existing poured gypsum or (Optional) Min. 1.5 | ¢ g\ Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD ISO G-0SIA GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -230.0
gypsum plank inch GenFlex I1SO
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch . - . . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, N
G-5. aypsum plank GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 LVOC-BA-1168 257.5
Existi Min. 1.5-inch Min. 0.25-inch D Deck ECUROCK -Fi Roof
G-6. xisting poured gypsum or in. 1.5-inc| Polyset CR-20 in. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roo Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -195.0*
gypsum plank GenFlex ISO Board
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
-7. Pol R-2 Pol R-2 -240.0*
G gypsum plank GenFlex ISO olyset CR-20 Roof Board olyset CR-20 LVOC-BA-1168 0.0
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or
G-8. 1.5.0. STICK 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA -112.5%
gypsum plank GenFlex ISO SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board enriex /
Existing poured gypsum or Min. 1.5-inch (Optional) Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-BA- N
G9. gypsum plank GenFlex ISO 1.5.0. STICK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.5.0. STICK 1168 125
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS:
GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO
Existi i in. 1.5- : ) . .
G-10. isting poured gypsum or (Optional) Min. 1.5 G-OSIA Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD 1SO G-OSIA / XR stick, 4-inch o.c. (full -230.0
gypsum plank inch GenFlex I1ISO coverage)

TABLE 6B: GYPSUM DECKS - NEW CONSTUCTION or REROOF (TEAR-OFF)

SYSTEM TYPE A-2: MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ANCHOR SHEET, BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Anchor Sheet Base Insulation Top Insulation
System Deck Fast . . Roof Cover (Note MDP
No. Note 1 T asten Attach T ac T ac 15) (psf)
( ) ype (Note 11) ac ype (Notes 6,7,8) ype (Notes 6,7,8)
Existing SBS Base, SBS Trufast Twin 9-inch o.c. in the min. 2-inch lap ) ) (Optional) Min. 0,25—|nc.h
. . R . Min. 1.5-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime GenFlex EZTPO /
G-11. gypsum Premium Base, MB Loc-Nail and 18-inch o.c. in two, equally 1.5.0. STICK . 1.5.0. STICK -45.0*
GenFlex ISO or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber EZ-BA
deck Base or APP 160 (MCRF > 105 Ibf) | spaced center rows
= Roof Board
Existing SBS Base, SBS Trufast Twin 9-inch o.c. in the min. 2-inch lap ) ) (Optional) M'm. 0-25-inch
. . R . Min. 1.5-inch DensDeck Prime or GenFlex EZTPO /
G-12. gypsum Premium Base, MB Loc-Nail and 18-inch o.c. in two, equally 1.5.0. STICK . 1.5.0. STICK -45.0*
GenFlex ISO SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber LVOC-BA-1168
deck Base or APP 160 (MCRF > 105 Ibf) | spaced center rows
= Roof Board
NEMO ETC, LLC Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Certificate of Authorization #32455 7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION Revision 1: 09/25/2020

©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017 Appendix 1, Page 37 of 44



TABLE 7A: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Substrate h n Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attac Type Attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
GENFLEX EZ TPO SYSTEMS
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
Flex EZ TP EZ-BA,
R-1 or granule surface with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.5-inch Firestone FiberTop Hot Asphalt GenFlex o/ ! -135.0*
p X LVOC-BA-1168
modified bitumen GenFlex ISO
Existing asphaltic BUR
GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
R-2 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Hot Asphalt (Optional) Tapered GenFlex ISO Hot asphalt enriex / ! -180.0*
. X LVOC-BA-1168
modified bitumen
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex I1SO . . . .
R-3 or granule surface with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Hot Asphalt GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -195.0*
. . Roof Board
modified bitumen GenFlex ISO
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex I1SO
R-4 or granule surface with optional Tapered Hot Asphalt Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | Hot Asphalt gi?ﬂz);ﬂ TPO/LVOC -195.0*
modified bitumen GenFlex ISO
Existing asphaltic BUR (Optional)
R-5 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO G-OSIA Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck, DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber | G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -157.5*
modified bitumen Roof Board
Existing asphaltic BUR .
. . (Optional) GenFlex EZ TPO / LVOC-
R-6 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO G-OSIA G-OSIA -157.5*
granule : : ' X Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board BA-1168
modified bitumen
Existing asphaltic BUR . ) .
(Optional) Min. 1.5-inch ) . GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, N
R-7 or gr.zarlule .surface GenFlex ISO G-OSIA Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD I1SO G-OSIA LVOC-BA-1168 157.5
modified bitumen
Existing granule surface ) ) (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, «
R8 modified bitumen Min. 1-inch GenFlex 1SO G-OSIA Tapered GenFlex ISO G-OSIA WBBA-P 450
R-9 Existing granule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex G-OSIA (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch G-OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, 247.5%
modified bitumen Coated Glass Facer Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer WBBA-P ’
R-10 Existing granule surface gﬂé:;:llé;ngza?:gz:slsso or G-0SIA (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch G-0SIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, 262.5*
modified bitumen Facer Tapered GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
Existing granule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA
R-11 i .g g | GenFlex Coated Glass G-0OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.5-inch G-OSIA ’ -135.0*
modified bitumen WBBA-P
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
L Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
R-12 EXISt!rTg gra.nule surface GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.5-inch G-0OSIA GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, -262.5*
modified bitumen LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA
Facer GenFlex HD 1SO
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
E EZ BB.
R-13 r::;;;ij';;ﬂqe:nurface GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch G-OSIA GWe;;/I-\e; TPO / WBBA, -135.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 38 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 7A: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Substrate h n Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type LEE Type attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
R-14 :E::;;Eidgr;;il:esnurface GenFlex Coated Glass G-0OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch G-0SIA f\(/agzl_eBiEZ TPO/EZ-BA, -247.5*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
. Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
R-15 ?;s;;;idg;;:ﬂ:esnurface GenFlex Coated Glass G-0OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch G-0OSIA S\TS??A?ITGZO / EZ-BA, -262.5*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Existing asphaltic BUR
Flex EZ TP EZ-BA,
R-16 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 (Optional) Additional layers base insulation Polyset CR-20 GenFlex o/ ! -262.5%
e X LVOC-BA-1168
modified bitumen
Existing asphaltic BUR
R-17 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board Polyset CR-20 GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA -195.0*
modified bitumen
Existing asphaltic BUR
GenFlex EZ TPO / EZ-BA,
R-18 or granule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Polyset CR-20 Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board | Polyset CR-20 L\(IESC—eBXA—IIGS / ! -240.0*
modified bitumen
Existing granule surface . ) (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, .
R-19 modified bitumen Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO 1.S.0. FIX 1l Tapered GenFlex ISO 1.S.0. FIX I WBBA-P -45.0
R-20 EX|st!rTg gra.nule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex 1S.0. FIX I (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch 15.0. FIX II GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, 195.0%
modified bitumen Coated Glass Facer Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer WBBA-P
in. 1-i . -, . . . .
R-21 Existing granule surface GM;:FIe;nSZaf:;IZT:SISSO or 15.0. FIX I (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch 15.0. FIX Il GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, -195.0%
modified bitumen Facer T Tapered GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer e LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA ’
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
E EZ BB.
R-22 X|st!n.g grgnule surface GenFlex Coated Glass 1.S.0. FIX 1l GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.5-inch 1.5.0. FIX Il GenFlex EZTPO / WBBA, -135.0*
modified bitumen WBBA-P
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
Exist | f; GenFlex EZ TP EZ-BA,
R-23 XIS mg gra.nu € surtace GenFlex Coated Glass 1.S.0. FIX 1l GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.5-inch 1.5.0. FIX Il enrlex o/ ! -195.0*
modified bitumen LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
. Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
Exist | f; GenFlex EZ TP WBBA
R-24 n;(:d;?iidggsslr:esnur ace GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. FIX 1l GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch 1.S.0. FIX 1l V\/egBAe-)l; o/ ! -135.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
. Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
R-25 2‘:;;255;?:‘:;””“9 GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. FIX II GenFlex 1SO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. FIX II ﬁfg?‘:fg;; L/vEchQA -195.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board !
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO . . . . . .
R-26 or granule surface or GenFlex Coated Glass 15.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch 15.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, 45.0%
. . Tapered GenFlex ISO WBBA-P
modified bitumen Facer

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 39 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 7A: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Substrate h n Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type LEE Type attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO . - . . . .
R-27 or granule surface or GenFlex Coated Glass 15.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch 15.0. STICK GenFlex EZ TPO / WBBA, -60.0*
. . Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer WBBA-P
modified bitumen Facer
Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO
- . (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation and/or min. 0.5-inch GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA, "
R-28 Existing asphaltic BUR g;iinFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK Tapered GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA 60.0
Existing aranule surface Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
R-29 . 'g & . or GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK (Optional) Additional layers of base insulation 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA, -120.0%
modified bitumen
Facer WBBA, WBBA-P
Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
R-30 or granule surface or GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.5-inch 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA, -60.0*
modified bitumen Facer GenFlex HD I1SO WBBA, WBBA-P
Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
R-31 Existing asphaltic BUR or GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA, -60.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board WBBA, WBBA-P
_ Min. 1.5-inch GenFlex ISO GenFlex EZTPO / EZ-BA,
Existing granule surface . . . .
R-32 . . or GenFlex Coated Glass 1.S.0. STICK Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board 1.5.0. STICK LVOC-BA-1168, LVOC-BA, -120.0*
modified bitumen
Facer WBBA, WBBA-P
GENFLEX EZ FLEECE BACKED TPO SYSTEMS
L Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
E EZ B
R-33 xisting granule surface | o4 oe cyroCK Hot Asphalt None N/A GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed | ., .
modified bitumen . TPO / Hot Asphalt
Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Existing aranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-34 modifiidgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. FIX 1l GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. FIX I TPO / Hot Asphalt -195.0%
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board P
Existing granule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-35 modiﬁidgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch G-OSIA TPO / Hot Asphalt -262.5*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board P
Existing granule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-36 modiﬁidgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. STICK TPO / Hot Asphalt -352.5%
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board P
Existing granule- Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
R-37 surfaced, asphaltic Prime or SECUROCK Hot Asphalt None N/A ?sgl}liszFZBgzece Backed -300.0*
modified bitumen Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
R-38 Existing granule surface mg';’;::?if:jg;lssso 1.S.0. FIX 1I; 1.S.0. (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.S.0. GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 112.5%
modified bitumen Facer STICK; G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer STICK; G-OSIA TPO / EZ-FBBA ’

NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2

Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 40 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC



TABLE 7A: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Substrate h n Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attac Type Attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
Existing eranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-39 . .g g . GenFlex Coated Glass G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch G-OSIA -262.5%
modified bitumen TPO / EZ-FBBA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
Existing aranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-40 modiﬂidgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass G-0OSIA GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch G-0OSIA TPO / EZ-FBBA -262.5*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Existing aranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-41 . 'g & . GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch 1.5.0. STICK -195.0%
modified bitumen TPO / EZ-FBBA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
Existing aranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-42 modifisdgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass 1.S.0. FIX I GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. FIX Il TPO / EZ-FBBA -195.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered
- . . . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-43 Existing asphaltic BUR GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or Tapered GenFlex Coated Glass Facer; Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. STICK TPO / EZ-FBBA -60.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Existing eranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-44 ) .g = . GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch 1.5.0. STICK -352.5*
modified bitumen TPO / EZ-FBBA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO
Existing eranule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-45 modifiidgbitumen GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. STICK GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch 1.5.0. STICK TPO / EZ-FBBA -300.0*
Facer DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board
Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck
Prime or SECUROCK
- . i 1.S.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed "
R-46 Existing asphaltic BUR Gyps'um-Flb.er Roof Board STICK; G-OSIA None N/A TPO / XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -45.0
or min. 0.5-inch GenFlex
HD ISO
R-47 Existing granule surface ’c\a/ll'lg.et;::c(?ogteendl:lgl);lsss,o 1.S.0. FIX1I; 1.S.0. (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.S.0. GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed 142.5%
modified bitumen Facer STICK; G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer STICK; G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. ’
R-48 Existing granule surface mg';’;::?if:jg;lssso 1.5.0. FIX1I; 1.S.0. (Optional) Additional layer of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered 1.5.0. FIX II; 1.S.0. _?sgljixRE;iilfe:_einiiczecd 172.5%
modified bitumen STICK; G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer STICK; G-OSIA ‘ - ’
Facer (full coverage)
L Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered ) GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-49 EXISt!rTg gra.nule surface GenFlex Coated Glass 1.5.0. FIX11; 1.5.0. GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch 5.0 FIX II; 1.5.0. TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch -45,0%*
modified bitumen STICK; G-OSIA STICK; G-OSIA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO o.C.
i1 " — - - in. 0.5
vso | Ems e srtce | SN RSO0 [0 150, | QOGS e ot 5 050 e 15 i 150, | Gorfe s e |,
modified bitumen Facer STICK; G-OSIA GenFlex HD ISO Y o STICK; G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. ’

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 41 of 44

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



TABLE 7A: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE A-1: BONDED INSULATION, BONDED ROOF COVER

Base Insulation Layer Top Insulation Layer
System Substrate h n Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Attac Type Attac (psf)
(Notes 6,7,8) (Notes 6,7,8)
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered ) GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-51 EX|st!r!g gra.nule surface GenFlex Coated Glass 1-S.0. FIX11; 1.5.0. GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 0.5-inch 5.0 FIX II; 1.5.0. TPO / XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -172.5%
modified bitumen STICK; G-OSIA STICK; G-OSIA
Facer GenFlex HD ISO (full coverage)
- Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or . Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered . GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-52 f:;s;;;idgzzzjrlsesnurface GenFlex Coated Glass ls_?ngFg(_g’S::o GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch gf_ngFgX(l)l's:Aso TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch -45,0%*
Facer ! DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board ’ o.c.
Existing granule surface Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or 15.0. FIXII; 1.5.0. Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5—|n.ch Tape‘red 15.0. FIX I; 1.5.0. GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
R-53 modified bitumen GenFlex Coated Glass STICK: G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch STICK: G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 6-inch o.c -60.0*
Facer ! DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board ’ ’ -
. Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
E | f; 1.S.0. FIX1I; 1.S.0. . . 1.5.0. FIX 11; 1.S.0. . K
R-54 r:s;;;sf;;:’::ﬂ“ ace GenFlex Coated Glass S?ISK- G-O,SlAs ° GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by Min. 0.25-inch Sil(c:)K- G-OSIAS ° TPO / XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -172.5*
Facer ’ DensDeck Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board ’ (full coverage)
_ Min. 1-inch GenFlex I1SO or Optional additional layers of base insulation or min. 0.5-inch Tapered GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed
Existing granule surface 1.5.0. FIX 1I; 1.S.0. . . 1.5.0. FIXII; 1.S.0. . .
- FI | Flex | Fl lass F foll . 19/32-inch TPO / XR Stick, 12-inch -45.0*
R-55 modified bitumen GenFlex Coated Glass STICK; G-OSIA GenFlex ISO or GenFlex Coated Glass Facer followed by min. 19/32-inc STICK; G-OSIA 0O / XR Stick, 12-inc 45.0
Facer plywood o.c.
- . . . 1.5.0. FIX1I; 1.S.0. (Optional) Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD I1SO or Min. 0.25-inch DensDeck 1.5.0. FIX 11; 1.S.0. GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed *
R-56 Existing asphaltic BUR Min. 1-inch GenFlex ISO STICK; G-OSIA Prime or SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber Roof Board STICK; G-OSIA TPO / XR Stick, 4-incho.c. | 172
Min. 0.5-inch GenFlex HD
ISO or Min. 0.25-inch
R-57 Existing asphaltic BUR DensDeck Prime or Is1S_I::)KFI6)((IJI,SIIASO None N/A ?sgl;lixRESZtiilkee:?nliicI;ecd -172.5*%
SECUROCK Gypsum-Fiber ! ’ -
Roof Board

NEMO ETC, LLC

Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION

GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 42 of 44




TABLE 7B: STEEL - RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE C-2: PLATE-BONDED ROOF COVER
Note: All areas where the existing metal panels do not lay flush on the underlying purlin shall have a 0.25-inch diameter pilot hole pre-drilled into the panel prior to driving the Purlin Fastener into the purlin.

NEmo | etc.

Syst Substrate Attach MDP
ystem Insulation Layer a Roof Cover (Note 18)
No. (Note 1) Fasten (Note 11) Spacing (psf)
E;Eftlcnogvztrznhdal\rlﬁsenim o;/l;g_is::hrrl;nniaxl One or more layers, any GenFast Purlin Fastener (T) and 12-inch o.c. alon GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld
R-58 . . 8 - ' combination, preliminarily fastened GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates ) e J Plates with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and -45.0
%-inch thick steel purlins spaced max. 60- . . purlins . R .
inch o.c per FM Approvals requirements are fastened through to purlins weighted RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.
Existing standing seam or lap seam metal One or more layers, any GenFast Purlin Fastener (T) and 6-inch o.c. alon GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld
R-59 roof covers having min. %-inch thick steel combination, preliminarily fastened GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates urlins e € Plates with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and -52.5
purlins spaced max. 120-inch o.c. per FM Approvals requirements are fastened through to purlins P weighted RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.
f:sftlcnogvztrznhdzxisenim o;/lfg_is:cahnl;n;t;axl One or more layers, any GenFast Purlin Fastener (T) and 6-inch o.c. alon GenFlex EZ TPO bonded to GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld
R-60 . . J - ' combination, preliminarily fastened GenFlex EZ TPO InvisiWeld Plates o € Plates with RhinoBond Portable Plate Bonding Tool and -82.5
Y-inch thick steel purlins spaced max. 60- ; . purlins . . .
inch o.c. per FM Approvals requirements are fastened through to purlins weighted RhinoBond Cooling Clamps.

TABLE 7C: STEEL - RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-1: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER

Note: All areas where the existing metal panels do not lay flush on the underlying purlin shall have a 0.25-inch diameter pilot hole pre-drilled into the panel prior to driving the Purlin Fastener into the purlin.

System Deck Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasteners (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Existing standing seam or lap seam metal roof covers One or more prelim GenFast Purlin Fastener (T) 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps spaced max. 90-
R-61 having min. 3/16-inch to max. %-inch thick steel purlins | layers, any attach;ad GenFlex EZTPO and GenFast HD Seam Plates inch o.c. to engage steel purlin. Laps sealed with 1.5- -45.0
spaced max. 90-inch o.c. combination inch heat weld.
Existing standing seam or lap seam metal roof covers One or more prelim GenFast Purlin Fastener (T) 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps spaced max. 142-
R-62 having min. 3/16-inch to max. %-inch thick steel purlins | layers, any attach;ad GenFlex EZTPO and GenFast HD Seam Plates inch o.c. to engage steel purlin. Laps sealed with 1.5- -52.5
spaced max. 142-inch o.c. combination inch heat weld.

TABLE 7D: STEEL - RECOVER

SYSTEM TYPE D-2: INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER (RMA STRIPS)
Note: All areas where the existing metal panels do not lay flush on the underlying purlin shall have a 0.25-inch diameter pilot hole pre-drilled into the panel prior to driving the Purlin Fastener into the purlin.

System Deck Insulation Roof Cover (Note 15 & 17) MDP
No. (Note 1) Type Attach Membrane Fasten (Note 11) Attach (psf)
Existing standing seam or lap Fireﬁone UltraPly QuickSeam B.M.A. Sfcrips are applied' over the insulation spac'ed 120-inch o.c.
seam metal roof covers One or more GenFast Purlin FJ05|t|oned oyer ez?ch steel purlin location. The batten is centered over each strip and fastened
R-63 having min. 3/16-inch to max. layers, any Prelim. GenFlex EZ Fastener (T? and into the purlins 6-inch o.c. 450
Yiinch thick steel purlins combi’nation attached TPO GenFast Coiled Bar Roof cover adhered to each strip by first priming the membrane underside with Firestone
spaced max. 10-inch o.c. Anchor UltraPly TPO QuickPrime at the strip location, then rolling into place with a hand roller. The min.
2-inch side laps are sealed with a min. 1.5-inch outside heat weld.

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 43 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017




TABLE 7E: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

NEmoO | etc.

SYSTEM TYPE E-1: NON-INSULATED, MECHANICALLY ATTACHED ROOF COVER

Roof Cover (Note 15)
System No. Deck (Note 1) MDP (psf)
Type Fasteners (Note 11) Attachment

. GenFlex EZ Fleece GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with GenFast HD 12-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed
R-64 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel Backed TPO Plus Seam Plates with 1.5-inch heat weld. -45.0
R-65 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 33 steel min. GenFlex EZ Fleece GenFast HD Fasteners with GenFast HD Seam Plates 6-'|nch o.<':. within 6-inch wide laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed 450

2,500 psi structural concrete Backed TPO with 1.5-inch heat weld.

. GenFlex EZ Fleece GenFast HD Plus Fasteners (steel only) with GenFast HD 6-inch o.c. within 6-inch wide laps spaced 114-inch o.c. Laps sealed

R-66 Min. 22 ga., type B, Grade 80 steel Backed TPO Plus Seam Plates with 1.5-inch heat weld. 67:5

TABLE 7F: RECOVER APPLICATIONS

SYSTEM TYPE F: NON-INSULATED, BONDED ROOF COVER

Roof Cover (Note 15)
System Deck Primer MDP
No. (Notes 1 & 12) Type Application
(psf)
R-67 Existing asphaltic BUR or granule-surfaced modified bitumen roof cover None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO XR Stick, 12-inch o.c. -45.0*
R-68 Existing granule-surfaced, asphaltic modified bitumen roof cover None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO XR Stick, 6-inch o.c. -142.5%
R-69 Existing asphaltic BUR over structural concrete deck None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -315.0*
R-70 Existing granule surfaced SBS modified bitumen over structural concrete deck None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -392.5
R-71 Existing granule surfaced APP modified bitumen over structural concrete deck None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO XR Stick, 4-inch o.c. -422.5
R-72 E):i::g:j Z(s:;rklaltic BUR or granule surface modified bitumen over structural concrete None GenFlex EZ Fleece Backed TPO Hot asphalt -495.0%

NEMO ETC, LLC
Certificate of Authorization #32455
©2019, NEMO ETC, LLC

Evaluation Report 9545.06.15-1-R1 for FL17802-R2
Revision 1: 09/25/2020
Appendix 1, Page 44 of 44

7™ EDITION (2020) FBC HVHZ EVALUATION
GenFlex EZ TPO Single Ply Roof Systems; (317) 575-7017



	2020_09_25_FINAL_ER_GENFLEX_TPO_HVHZ_FL17802-R2.pdf
	2020_09_25_FINAL_A1_ER_GENFLEX_TPO_HVHZ_FL17802-R2.pdf

